
CITY OF FEDERAL WAY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS

DESTROYED EXPIRED TRANSFERRED TO STATE ARCHIVES

C AG# PROVIDER DESCRIPTION EXP DATE RETENTION 
DATE

CONTRACT 
AMOUNT TYPE DEPT

2023 179 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF 
ECOLOGY (DOE)

POLLUTION PREVENTION ASSISTANCE PARTNERSHIP WITH ECOLOGY 06/30/25 2031 $198,830.61 INTERLOCAL PW

2023 163 CITY OF AUBURN BUILDING OFFICE LEASE FOR PUGET SOUND AUTO THEFT TASK-
FORCE

06/30/25 2031 $50,000.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2023 154 PORT OF SEATTLE ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT PARTNERSHIP AGREEMENT 12/31/23 2029 $60,000.00 INTERLOCAL ED
2023 153 KENT CITY JAIL JAIL SERVICES AGREEMENT - INMATE HOUSING 12/31/28 2034 $350,000.00 INTERLOCAL PD
2023 146 WSDOT MILITARY ROAD S PRESERVATION 12/31/26 2032 $600,000.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2023 126 CITY OF SEATTLE EDWARD BYRNE MEMORIAL JUSTICE ASSISTANCE GRANT (JAG) 
FISCAL YEAR FY2022

09/30/25 2031 $38,387.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2023 123 KING COUNTY JAIL JAIL SERVICES AGREEMENT 12/31/24 2030 $548,000.00 INTERLOCAL PD
2023 072 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF 

COMMERCE
GMA PERIODIC UPDATES COMMERCE INTERLOCAL 06/30/23 2029 $87,500.00 INTERLOCAL CD

2023 064 ISSAQUAH JAIL JAIL SERVICES AGREEMENT ONGOING $401,500.00 INTERLOCAL PD
2023 048 DSHS RESPITE IN COMMUNITY SETTINGS 03/31/26 2032 INTERLOCAL PK
2023 047 STATE OF WASHINGTON HIGHLINE COLLEGE 2023 HIGHLINE COLLEGE SMALL BUSINESS DEVELOPMENT CENTER 

(SBDC) INTERAGENCY AGREEMENT
12/31/23 2029 $24,000.00 INTERLOCAL MAYOR

2023 017 NISQUALLY JAIL JAIL SERVICES AGREEMENT UNTIL 
AMENDED

$200,000.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2023 009 SCORE JAIL JAIL SERVICES AGREEMENT 12/31/24 2030 $1,100,000.00 INTERLOCAL PD
2022 150 VALLEY NARCOTICS ENFORCEMENT TEAM/ 

KENT POLICE DEPARTMENT
DEA HIDTA AGREEMENT FOR FISCAL YEAR 2022-2026 09/30/26 2032 INTERLOCAL PD

2022 130 SEATTLE POLICE DEPARTMENT INTERNET CRIMES AGAINST CHILDREN TASK FORCE ONGOING INTERLOCAL PD
2022 125 FEDERAL WAY POLICE DEPARTMENT - LEAD 

AGENCY
PUGET SOUND AUTO THEFT TASK FORCE INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT ONGOING INTERLOCAL PD

2022 108 CJTC BLEA TAC-OFFICER AGREEMENT- WASINGTON STATE CRIMINAL JUSTICE 
TRAINING COMMISSION (CLTC) BASIC LAW ENFORCEMENT ACADEMY 
(BLEA)

09/30/25 2031 INTERLOCAL PD

2022 090 DEPARTMENT OF SOCIAL & HEALTH SERVICES 
(DSHS)

DSHS DATASHARE AGREEMENT 08/30/27 2033 N/A INTERLOCAL MC

2022 075 WSDOT ADAPTIVE TRAFFIC SIGNAL CONTROL - CITY CENTER - PHASE 2 12/31/25 2031 $744,004.00 INTERLOCAL PW
2022 067 WASHINGTON LEARNING SOURCE

PUGET SOUND EDUCATIONAL SERVICE 
DISTRICT (PSESD)

WLS COOPERATIVE PURCHASING AGREEMENT PERPETUAL N/A INTERLOCAL IT

2022 061 PUYALLUP CITY JAIL JAIL SERVICES - INMATE HOUSING AUTO RENEW 2029 INTERLOCAL PD

2022 058 WASHINGTON TRAFFIC SAFETY COMMISSION 
(WTSC)

WALKER AND ROLLER PROGRAM 09/30/22 2028 $5,000.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2022 055 WASHINGTON ASSOCIATION OF SHERIFFS AND 
POLICE CHIEFS (WASPC)

BEHAVIORAL HEALTH SUPPORT AND SUICIDE PREVENTION GRANT 06/30/23 2029 $18,180.00 INTERLOCAL PD

COLOR KEY POTENTIAL ARCHIVAL ORIGINAL 
TO PW 

PAGE 1 OF 32 LAST REVISED 9/29/2023



CITY OF FEDERAL WAY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS

2022 053 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF 
TRANSPORTATION (WSDOT)

ADAPTIVE TRAFFIC CONTROL PROGRAM ONGOING N/A INTERLOCAL PW

2022 046 SEATTLE POLICE DEPARTMENT GRANTS & 
CONTRACTS UNIT (SPD)

DISTRIBUTION AGREEMENT ONGOING N/A INTERLOCAL PD

2022 043 STATE OF WASHINGTON HIGHLINE COLLEGE 2022 SMALL BUSINESS DEVELOPMENT CENTER (SBDC) INTERAGENCY 
AGREEMENT

12/31/22 2028 $20,000.00 INTERLOCAL ED

2022 039 WASHINGTON ASSOCIATION OF SHERIFFS & 
POLICE CHIEFS (WASPC)

LAW ENFORCEMENT ACCREDITATION PROGRAM 12/31/22 2028 $100.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2022 006 CITY OF BURIEN, CITY OF DES MOINES, CITY 
OF NORMANDY PARK, CITY OF SEATAC

STUDY RELATED TO SCHOOL RESILIENCE TO AIR POLLUTION 12/31/22 2028 $12,500.00 INTERLOCAL MAYOR

2021 203 NATIONAL COOPERATIVE PURCHASING 
ALLIANCE (NCPA)

NCPA COOPERATIVE PURCHASING AGREEMENT PERPETUAL N/A N/A INTERLOCAL IT

2021 202 STATE OF TEXAS, DEPARTMENT OF 
INFORMATION RESOURCES

TEXAS DIR COOPERATIVE PURCHASING AGREEMENT PERPETUAL N/A N/A INTERLOCAL IT

2021 200 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF 
TRANSPORTATION (WSDOT)

COMMUTE TRIP REDUCTION (CTR) AGREEMENT 06/30/23 2029 PAY CITY INTERLOCAL PW

2021 194 WSDOT LAKOTA MIDDLE SCHOOL SAFE ROUTES TO SCHOOL UPON 
COMPLETION

$5,000.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2021 190 WASHINGTON TRAFFIC SAFETY COMMISSION 
(WTSC)

INTERAGENCY AGREEMENT BETWEEN THE WASHINGTON TRAFFIC 
SAFETY COMMISSION AND FEDERAL WAY POLICE DEPARTMENT

09/30/22 2028 $170,000.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2021 188 WSDOT CITYWIDE PEDESTRAIN SAFETY IMPROVEMENTS 12/31/28 2034 $1,735,997.00 INTERLOCAL PW
2021 184 HIGHLINE COLLEGE INTERAGENCY AGREEMENT BETWEEN HIGHLINE COLLEGE AND CITY 

OF FEDERAL WAY
12/31/21 2027 $20,000.00 INTERLOCAL ED

2021 181 WSDOT S 348TH ST NHS PRESERVATION PROJECT PE FUNDING OBLIGATIONS 12/31/26 20232 $1,116,000.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2021 168 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS SCHOOL RESOURCE OFFICERS 09/01/23 2029 INTERLOCAL PD
2021 163 WSDOT 27TH AVE SW AT SW 344TH ST COMPACT RAB 12/30/26 2032 $710,000.00 INTERLOCAL PW
2021 152 TRANSPO GROUP USA, INC. S 288TH ROAD DIET (16TH AVE S T0 34TH AVE S) 06/30/24 2030 $438,044.42 INTERLOCAL PW
2021 151 CITY OF SEATTLE FY21 EDWARD BRYNE MEMORIAL JUSTICE ASSISTANCE (JAG) GRANT 10/31/25 2031 $39,550.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2021 145 WSDOT S 288TH STREET ROAD DIET ONGOING $100,000.00 INTERLOCAL PW
2021 142 VALLEY NARCOTICS ENFORCEMENT TEAM/ 

KENT POLICE DEPARTMENT
DEA HIDTA AGREEMENTS FOR FISCAL YEAR 2021-2022 09/30/22 2028 INTERLOCAL PD

2021 141 KING COUNTY SHERIFF'S OFFICE KC RSO OVERTIME COST REIMBURSEMENT AGREEMENT 06/30/22 2028 $16,841.98 INTERLOCAL PD

2021 137 DEPARTMENT OF ECOLOGY SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT COMMUNITY LITTER CLEANUP 
AGREEMENT

06/30/23 2029 $40,000.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2021 129 DEPT. OF ECOLOGY SOLID WASTE 
MANAGEMENT 

2021-2023 LOCAL SOLID WASTE FINANCIAL ASSISTANCE GRANT 06/30/23 2029 THEY  PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2021 124 WSDOT SW DASH POINT RD & 47TH AVE SW COMPACT ROUNDABOUT 12/31/24 2030 $970,400.00 INTERLOCAL PW
2021 120 LAKEHAVEN WATER & SEWER DISTRICT SW 356TH STREET PRESERVATION PROJECT UPON 

COMPLETION
$5,980.46 INTERLOCAL PW

2021 119 LAKEHAVEN WATER & SEWER DISTRICT SW 320TH STREET PRESERVATION PROJECT UPON 
COMPLETION

$11,060.50 INTERLOCAL PW

2021 114 KING COUNTY ROAD DIVISION RENTON STORMWATER DECANT FACILITY USE 12/30/23 2024 INTERLOCAL PW
2021 106 WTSC INTERAGENCY AGREEMENT BETWEEN WASHINGTON TRAFFIC SAFETY 

COMMISSION AND FEDERAL WAY POLICE DEPARTMENT
09/30/21 2027 $2,500.00 INTERLOCAL PD

PAGE 2 OF 32 LAST REVISED 9/29/2023



CITY OF FEDERAL WAY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS

2021 103 WASHINGTON AUTO THEFT PREVENTION 
AUTHORITY (WATPA)

WATPA GRANT FOR PSATT TASK FORCE 06/30/23 2029 $2,627,752.76 INTERLOCAL PD

2021 091 ISSAQUAH CITY JAIL JAIL SERVICES CONTRACT - ISSAQUAH CITY JAIL 12/31/22 2028 $402,000.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2021 090 KING COUNTY JAIL JAIL SERVICES CONTRACT - KING COUNTY JAIL 12/31/22 2028 $250,000.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2021 044 SOUTH KING HOUSING AND HOMELESSNESS 
PARTNERS (SKHHP)

POOLING SALES TAX RECEIPTS WITH SOUTH KING HOUSING AND 
HOMELESSNESS PARTNERS (SKHHP)

PERPETUAL INTERLOCAL

2021 038 WSDOT INTERAGENCY AGREEMENT - K1360 10/01/25 2031 INTERLOCAL PW
2021 032 PUBLIC HEALTH - SEATTLE & KING COUNTY HAZARDOUS WASTER MANAGEMENT PROGRAM - 2021-2022 GRANT 

FUNDING AGREEMENT
12/31/22 2028 THEY  PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2021 011 KING COUNTY SOLID WASTE DIVISION 2021-2022 WRR GRANT AGREEMENT 12/31/22 2028 THEY  PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2021 002 SCORE JAIL JAIL SERVICES CONTRACT 12/31/22 2028 $350,000.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2020 982 LAKEHAVEN WATER & SEWER DISTRICT  2020-2021 NEIGHBORHOOD TRAFFIC SAFETY (NTS) PROJECT - TASK 
ORDER 1

11/06/20 2026 $1,552.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2020 974 VALLEY NARCOTICS ENFORCEMENT  TEAM/ 
KENT POLICE DEPT.

DEA HIDTA AGREEMENTS FOR FISCAL YEAR 2020-2021 09/31/2021 2027 INTERLOCAL PD

2020 924 VALLEY INDEPENDENT INVESTIGATION TEAM 
(VIIT)

VALLEY INDEPENDENT INVESTIGATION TEAM AGREEMENT ONGOING INTERLOCAL PD

2020 861 CITY OF SEATTLE FY20 EDWARD BRYNE MEMORIAL JUSTICE ASSISTANCE (JAG) GRANT 09/30/24 2030 $42,546.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2020 556 LTCA, LLC PACIFIC HIGHWAY SUBSTATION 12/31/23 2027 $0.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2020 550 WSDOT H&LP SW 320TH STREET PRESERVATION PROJECT 12/31/22 2028 $518,000.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2020 075 PUGET SOUND EMERGENCY RADIO NETWORK 
(PSERN)

PSERN ILA ONGOING INTERLOCAL LAW

2020 065 WASTE MANAGEMENT OF WA LEASE OF OLD TARGET PARKING LOT TO WASTE MANAGEMENT OF 
WASHINGTON, INC.

09/30/20 2026 $41,160.00 INTERLOCAL PK

2020 044 LAKEHAVEN WATER & SEWER DISTRICT ILA FOR JOINT CONSTRUCTION ACTIVITIES 03/31/30 2036 INTERLOCAL PW
2020 044 LAKEHAVEN WATER & SEWER DISTRICT SW 320TH STREET PRESERVATION PROJECT UPON 

COMPLETION
$11,060.50 INTERLOCAL PW

2020 044 LAKEHAVEN WATER & SEWER DISTRICT SW 356TH STREET PRESERVATION PROJECT UPON 
COMPLETION

$5,980.46 INTERLOCAL PW

2020 039 KING COUNTY PSERN RADIO END USER SERVICE LEVEL AGREEMENT ONGOING INTERLOCAL PD
2020 038 CITY OF SEATTLE EDWARD BYRNE MEMORIAL JUSTICE ASSISTANCE GRANT FY2017 09/30/20 2026 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PD

2020 037 CITY OF SEATTLE EDWARD BYRNE MEMORIAL JUSTICE ASSISTANCE GRANT FY2018 09/30/22 2028 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PD

2020 036 CITY OF SEATTLE EDWARD BYRNE MEMORIAL JUSTICE ASSISTANCE GRAN TFY2019 09/30/23 2029 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PD
2020 035 KING COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF METRO 

TRANSIT
COMMUTE TRIP REDUCTION PROGRAM IMPLEMENTATION 
AGREEMENT WITH KING COUNTY

06/30/21 2027 $34,668.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2020 034 HIGHLINE COLLEGE INTERAGENCY AGREEMENT BETWEEN HIGHLINE COLLEGE AND CITY 
OF FEDERAL WAY

12/31/20 2026 $20,000.00 INTERLOCAL ED

2020 032 KING COUNTY KING COUNTY PARK LEVY AGREEMENT 12/31/25 2031 INTERLOCAL PK

PAGE 3 OF 32 LAST REVISED 9/29/2023



CITY OF FEDERAL WAY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS

2020 031 PSE JOINT CONSTRUCTION AGREEMENT WITH PSE FOR 2020 OVERLAY 12/31/22 2028 $381,080.60 INTERLOCAL PW

2020 020 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF 
TRANSPORTATION (WSDOT)

TRANSPORTATION DEMAND MANAGEMENT IMPLEMENTATION 
AGREEMENT

06/31/21 2027 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2020 019 SOUND TRANSIT TACOMA DOME LINK EXTENSION (TDLE) - PROJECT 
ADMINISTRATION AGREEMENT/TASK ORDER #3 

12/31/21 2027 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2020 017 LAKEHAVEN WATER & SEWER DISTRICT S DASH POINT RD SIDEWALK IMPROVEMENTS 12/31/21 2027 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2020 012 WASHINGTON TRAFFIC SAFETY COMMISSION GRANT FUNDING FOR TRAFFIC ENFORCEMENT 09/30/20 2026 $19,000.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2019 248 WSDOT LAKOTA MIDDLE SCHOOL - SW DASH POINT ROAD 12/31/25 2031 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW
2019 222 SOUND TRANSIT SOUND TRANSIT FEDERAL WAY LINK EXTENSION (FWLE) - CITY 

SERVICES AGREEMENT/TASK ORDER #2 (DESIGN REVIEW  & 
CONSTRUCTION SERVICES SUPPORT)

UPON 
COMPLETION

THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2019 221 KING COUNTY SHERIFF'S OFFICE KC RSO OVERTIME COST REIMBURSEMENT AGREEMENT 12/30/20 2026 $19,020.11 INTERLOCAL PD

2019 215 UNIVERSITY OF WASHINGTON (UW) UNIVERSITY OF WASHINGTON LAW ENFORCEMENT SERVICES 12/31/21 2027 INTERLOCAL PD

2019 214 PIERCE TRANSIT EXTRA DUTY POLICE SERVICES AGREEMENT 12/31/23 2029 INTERLOCAL PD
2019 210 SOUND TRANSIT SOUTH FEDERAL WAY STATION AREA VISION FRAMEWORK (PART OF 

TACOMA DOME LINK EXTENSION PROJECT/TDLE)
12/31/20 2026 N/A INTERLOCAL PW

2019 180 WASHINGTON CITIES INSURANCE AUTHORITY 
(WCIA)

WCIA PREMEMBERSHIP CONDITIONS 12/31/19 2026 N/A INTERLOCAL LAW

2019 179 WASHINGTON CITIES INSURANCE AUTHORITY 
(WCIA)

WCIA INTERLOCAL APPENDIX 149-19
INSURANCE COVERAGE FOR CITY ACTIVITIES & PROPERTY

ONGOING N/A INTERLOCAL LAW

2019 171 THE STATE OF WASHINGTON DEPARTMENT OF 
ECOLOGY

2019-2021 SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT LOCAL SOLID WASTE 
FINANCIAL ASSISTANCE AGREEMENT

06/30/21 2027 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2019 133 KENT CITY JAIL JAIL SERVICES - INMATE HOUSING ONGOING $350,000.00 INTERLOCAL PD
2019 111 FEDERAL WAY POLICE DEPARTMENT AMENDED AND RESTATED INTERLOCAL COOPERATIVE AGREEMENT 

FOR THE PSATT AUTO THEFT TASK FORCE
CONTINUOUS INTERLOCAL PD

2019 110 PUGET SOUND COMMERCIAL REAL ESTATE 
SERVICE

TWIN LAKES SUBSTATION 04/01/21 2027 INTERLOCAL PD

2019 089 SEATTLE POLICE DEPARTMENT WA STATE INTERAGENCY AGREEMENT-INTERNET CRIMES AGAINST 
CHILDREN TASK FORCE

ONGOING INTERLOCAL PD

2019 088 WASHINGTON TRAFFIC SAFETY COMMISSION 
(WTSC)

WTSC GRANT FUNDING FOR TRAFFIC ENFORCEMENT 09/30/19 2025 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PD

2019 069 PUYALLUP CITY JAIL JAIL SERVICES - INMATE HOUSING ONGOING $150,000.00 INTERLOCAL PD
2019 068 ISSAQUAH JAIL JAIL SERVICES - INMATE HOUSING 06/09/22 $200,000.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2019 067 KITTITAS COUNTY JAIL JAIL SERVICES - INMATE HOUSING 12/31/24 2030 $150,000.00 INTERLOCAL PD
2019 066 YAKIMA COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF 

CORRECTIONS
JAIL SERVICES - INMATE HOUSING 12/31/24 2030 $800,000.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2019 054 KING COUNTY MOA WITH KING COUNTY FOR FUNDING FAIR HOUSING TESTING 06/30/19 2025 $25,000.00 INTERLOCAL CD-HS

PAGE 4 OF 32 LAST REVISED 9/29/2023



CITY OF FEDERAL WAY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS

2019 020 SOUND TRANSIT TACOMA DOME LINK EXTENSION (TDLE) - PROJECT 
ADMINISTRATION AGREEMENT

ONGOING THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2019 019 SOUTH KING HOUSING & HOMELESS PARTNERS INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT FOR SKHHP PERPETUAL $26,000.00 INTERLOCAL CD

2019 018 KING COUNTY  SOLID WASTE DIVISION 2019-2020 WRR GRANT AGREEMENT 12/31/20 2026 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2019 015 PUBLIC HEALTH - SEATTLE AND KING COUNTY LOCAL HAZARDOUS WASTE MANAGEMENT PROGRAM - GRANT 
FUNDING AGREEMENT

12/31/20 2026 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2018 149 WASHINGTON STATE PATROL WSP INTERAGENCY AGREEMENT - MARIJUANA ERADICATION 2018 09/30/18 2024 $1,120.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2018 138 KING COUNTY SHERIFF'S OFFICE KC RSO OVERTIME COST REIMBURSEMENT AGREEMENT 06/30/19 2025 $23,578.44 INTERLOCAL PD

2018 092 SOUND TRANSIT TACOMA DOME LINK EXTENSION (TDLE) - PARTNERING AGREEMENT 12/31/30 2036 N/A INTERLOCAL PW

2018 087 PIERCE TRANSIT PIERCE TRANSIT EXTRA DUTY POLICE SERVICES AGREEMENT 10/14/19 2025 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PD

2018 067 KING COUNTY HISTORIC PRESERVATION (FOR LANDMARK DESIGNATION & 
PROTECTION SERVICES)

ONGOING SEE ATTACHED 
RATES

INTERLOCAL CD

2018 041 WASHINGTON TRAFFIC SAFETY COMMISSION WASHINGTON GRANT FUNDING FOR TRAFFIC EMPHASIS 
ENFORCEMENT

09/30/18 2024 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PD

2018 030 SOUTH KING FIRE AND RESCUE AGREEMENT BETWEEN CITY OF FEDERAL WAY AND SOUTH KING FIRE 
AND RESCUE RELATING TO OFFICE SPACE IN THE FEDERAL WAY CITY 
HALL BUILDING

02/22/28 2034 PLEASE SEE 
AGREEMENT

INTERLOCAL LAW

2018 028 COMMISSION ON ACCREDITATION FOR LAW 
ENFORCEMENT AGENCIES, INC (CALEA)

LAW ENFORCEMENT ACCREDITATION AGREEMENT ADDENDUM - 
PUBLICATIONS SUNBSCRIPTIONS AND ACCESS AGREEMENT

ONGOING $150.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2018 019 FEDERAL WAY SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 210 SCHOOL RESOURCE OFFICERS 08/31/20 2026 $490,000.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2017 188 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF 
TRANSPORTATION (WSDOT)

TRANSPORTATION DEMAND MANAGEMENT IMPLEMENTATION 
AGREEMENT GCB2751

06/30/19 2025 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2017 187 WASHINGTON STATE PATROL - COMMERCIAL 
VEHICLE DISIVION

WASP COMMERCIAL MOTOR VEHICLE INSPECTIONS 11/27/22 2028 $0.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2017 181 WSDOT (WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT 
OF TRANSPORTATION)

SW CAMPUS DRIVE PRESERVATION PROJECT (19TH AVE SW TO 1ST 
AVE S)
2018 NHS PRESERVATOIN PROJECT

12/31/19 2025 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2017 180 WSDOT (WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT 
OF TRANSPORTATION)

16TH AVE S PRESERVATION PROJECT (S 348TH ST TO PACIFIC HWY 
S)
2018 NHS PRESERVATION PROJECT

12/31/19 2025 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2017 179 KING COUNTY METRO TRANSIT COMMUTE TRIP REDUCTION PROGRAM IMPLEMENTATION 
AGREEMENT WITH KING COUNTY

06/30/19 2025 $33,646.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2017 169 CITY OF AUBURN PUGET SOUND AUTO THEFT TASK FORCE - OFFICE SPACE 06/30/23 2029 3,125/MONTH 
(BILLED 

QUARTERLY)

INTERLOCAL PD

2017 152 CITIES OF AUBURN, FEDERAL WAY & KENT RECIPROCAL EOC USE AGREEMENT ONGOING $0.00 INTERLOCAL MAYOR

PAGE 5 OF 32 LAST REVISED 9/29/2023



CITY OF FEDERAL WAY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS

2017 151 KING COUNTY SHERIFF'S OFFICE KING COUNTY RSO OVERTIME COST REIMBURSEMENT AGREEMENT 06/30/18 2024 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PD

2017 142 FEDERAL WAY SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 210 KING COUNTY WATER WORK GRANT
(INCLUDES STORMING THE SOUND WITH SALMON)

02/28/18 2024 $41,075.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2017 127 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF 
TRANSPORTATION (WSDOT)

MILITARY RD S/S 298TH COMPACT ROUNDABOUTS 12/31/21 2027 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2017 126 WA STATE DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION CITYWIDE ADAPTIVE CONTROL SYSTEM 12/31/25 2025 $1,397,127.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2017 125 KING COUNTY, DEPARTMENT OF 
TRANSPORTATION, METRO TRANSIT DIVISION

21ST AVE S /S 314TH ST - S 316TH ST PEDESTRIAN CONNECTION 
(AKA "GRAND STAIRCASE")

09/30/19 2025 $500,000.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2017 120 WASHINGTON STATE PATROL, PIERCE COUNTY 
SHERIFF'S OFFICE, KING COUNTY 
PROSECUTOR'S OFFICE, AND THE 
MUNICIPALITIES OF AUBURN, BONNEY LAKE, 
FEDERAL WAY, LAKEWOOD, TACOMA, AND 
TUKWILA FOR THE CREATION OF THE PUGET 
SOUND AUTO THEFT TASK-FORCE

INTERLOCAL COOPERATIVE AGREEMENT 1 YEAR, 
EFFECTIVE 

UPON 
ADOPTION OF 
WATPA GRANT

$0.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2017 118 SOUND TRANSIT FEDERAL WAY LINK EXTENSION (FWLE) - CITY SERVICES AGREEMENT UPON 
COMPLETION

THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2017 113 CITY OF SEATTLE EDWARD BYRNE MEMORIAL JUSTICE ASSISTANCE GRANT (JAG) 
PROGRAM FY 2016

09/30/19 2025 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PD

2017 053 PUBLIC HEALTH- SEATTLE & KING COUNTY LOCAL HAZARDOUS WASTE MANAGEMENT PROGRAM - GRANT 
FUNDING AGREEMENT

12/31/18 2024 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2017 041 KING COUNTY SOLID WASTE DIVISION 2017-2018 WRR GRANT AGREEMENT 12/31/18 2024 $114,862.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2017 028 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS WIRE THEFT ALARM SYSTEM WITH FEDERAL WAY SCHOOL DISTRICT 
AGREEMENT

ONGOING THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PK

2017 015 WA STATE DEPT. OF ENTERPRISE SERVICES ENERGY/UTILITY CONSERVATION PROJECT MANAGEMENT & 
MONITORING SERVICES

12/31/22 2028 $2,618,693.35 INTERLOCAL PW

2016 153 FOSTER SCHOOL OF BUSINESS CULINARY INSTITUTE 03/15/17 2023 $10,500.00 INTERLOCAL PAEC

2016 150 WASHINGTON TRAFFIC SAFETY COMMISSION INTERAGENCY AGREEMENT BETWEEN FEDERAL WAY POLICE 
DEPARTMENT AND WASHINGTON TRAFFIC SAFETY COMMISSION

09/30/17 2023 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PD

2016 136 VALLEY NARCOTICS ENFORCEMENT (VNET) INTERLOCAL COOPERATIVE AGREEMENT BETWEEN THE CITIES OF 
AUBURN, FEDERAL WAY, KENT, RENTON, SEATTLE, TUKWILA AND 
THE PORT OF SEATTLE FOR THE VALLEY NARCOTICS ENFORCEMENT

UNTIL 
TERMINATED

ONGOING $0.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2016 113 KING COUNTY SHERIFF'S OFFICE KC RSO OVERTIME COST REIMBURSEMENT AGREEMENT 06/30/17 2023 $25,052.27 INTERLOCAL PD

2016 063 KING COUNTY REGIONAL WASTEWATER 
TREATMENT DIVISON

WATER QUALITY IMPROVEMENT PROJECT 12/31/18 2024 $104,500.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2016 051 KING COUNTY WRIA 9 ILA (WATER RESOURCE INVENTORY AREA 9) 04/07/26 $23,935.00 COST 
SHARE PORTION

INTERLOCAL PW

PAGE 6 OF 32 LAST REVISED 9/29/2023



CITY OF FEDERAL WAY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS

2016 018 WSDOT (WSDOT NWR LOCAL PROGRAM) STEEL LAKE PARK TO DOWNTOWN TRAIL 06/30/19 2025 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2016 012 WA TRAFFIC SAFETY COMMISSION (WTSC) INTERAGENCY AGREEMENT-MULTIJURISDICTIONAL, HIGH VISIBILITY 
ENFORCEMENT TRAFFIC SAFETY EMPHASIS PATROL

09/30/16 2022 $23,900.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2015 215 KING COUNTY KC RSO OVERTIME COST REIMBURSMENT AGREEMENT 06/30/16 2022 $37,554.65 INTERLOCAL PD

2015 214 KING COUNTY KC AFIS COMPARISON OF CONTRACT ONGOING $0.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2015 213 WSDOT FEDERAL/STATE TRANSPORTATION DEMAND MANAGEMENT 
IMPLEMENTATION AGREEMENT (CTR IMPLEMENTATION AGREEMENT)

06/30/17 2023 $38,869.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2015 210 KING COUNTY METRO TRANSIT CTR IMPLEMENTATION AGREEMENT WITH KING COUNTY 06/30/17 2023 $33,646.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2015 186 WSDOT SACAJAWEA MIDDLE SCHOOL STREETS 12/31/19 2025 $1,200,000.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2015 179 US DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING & URBAN 
DEVELOPMENT

2015 CDBG ENTITLEMENT FUNDING AGREEMENT 09/01/22 2028 $617,465.00 INTERLOCAL CD

2015 178 COMMUNITY CONNECTIVITY CONSORTIUM COMMUNITY CONNECTIVITY CONSORTIUM INTERLOCAL/JOINING 
AGREEMENT

ONGOING N/A INTERLOCAL IT

2015 169 STATE OF WASHINGTON DEPARTMENT OF 
ECOLOGY

UPPER JOE'S CREEK WATERSHED NUTRIENT REDUCTION 06/30/17 2023 N/A INTERLOCAL PW

2015 167 PUGET SOUND ENERGY, INC. S 352ND EXTENSION PROJECT (SR 161 TO SR99) 12/31/16 2022 $94,132.24 INTERLOCAL PW

2015 165 KING COUNTY 2015 REGIONAL AERIAL FUNDING AGREEMENT WITH KING COUNTY 10/02/15 2021 $12,837.06 INTERLOCAL IT

2015 161 KING COUNTY REGIONAL COORDINATION FRAMEWORK FOR DISASTERS & PLANNED 
EVENTS

ONGOING N/A INTERLOCAL MAYOR

2015 156 KING COUNTY EFFECTIVENESS MONITORING OF THE S 356 ST RETROFIT & 
EXPANSION PROJECT

12/30/18 2024 $53,263.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2015 139 PUGET SOUND ENERGY, INC. 1ST AVE S AT S 328 ST INTERSECTION IMPROVEMENTS 06/21/16 2022 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2015 128 WSDOT CITY WIDE FLASHING YELLOW ARROW RETROFITS 09/30/18 2024 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2015 119 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT S 352ND STREET EXTENSION (SR 161 TO SR 99) 10/17/17 2023 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2015 118 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT S 356TH IMPROVEMENT PROJECT UPON 
COMPLETION

THEY PAY US
$353,9628.88

INTERLOCAL PW

2015 109 WASHINGTON TRAFFIC SAFETY COMMISSION PROMOTING TARGET ZERO FOR TRAFFIC SAFETY COMMISSION 09/30/15 2021 $1,500.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2015 041 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT PACIFIC HWY SOUTH HOV LANES PHASE V (S 340S ST TO S 359 ST) UPON 
COMPLETION

$231,000.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2015 036 PUGET SOUND EMERGENCY RADIO NETWORK 
(PSERN)

INTERLOCAL COOPERATION AGREEMENT 01/01/18 2022 $0.00 INTERLOCAL LAW

2015 035 HIGHLINE COLLEGE INTERAGENCY MODEL AGREEMENT WITH  STATE OF WASHINGTON 
HIGHLINE COLLEGE

ONGOING $22,500.00 INTERLOCAL MAYOR

PAGE 7 OF 32 LAST REVISED 9/29/2023



CITY OF FEDERAL WAY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS

2015 032 KING COUNTY INTERLOCAL FOR USE OF FINGERPRINT EQUIPMENT PROVIDED BY 
REGIONAL AFIS PROGRAM

09/26/15 2023 N/A INTERLOCAL PD

2014 168 KING COUNTY HOME INVESTMENT PARTNERSHIPS PROGRAM ILA FOR 2015-2017 12/31/26 2032 N/A INTERLOCAL CD

2014 166 KING COUNTY SHERIFF'S OFFICE KING COUNTY RSO OVERTIME COST REIMBURSEMENT AGREEMENT 06/30/15 2021 NO COST TO US; INTERLOCAL PD

2014 141 KING COUNTY PARKS PROPERTY TAX LEVY AGREEMENT 12/31/19 2025 N/A INTERLOCAL PK

2014 105 KING COUNTY RENEWAL OF CONTRACT FOR I-NET SERVICES 01/31/20 2026 $40,219.00 INTERLOCAL IT

2014 104 STATE OF WASHINGTON DATA SHARING AGREEMENT  06/30/16 2022 TBD IF PAYMENT 
REQUIRED

INTERLOCAL IT

2014 089 UNITED STATES, USDA - APHIS - WILDLIFE 
SERVICES

STEEL LAKE CANADA GEESE MANAGEMENT (AGREEMENT NO. 14-73-
53-6660-RA)

09/30/24 2029 $10,347.47 INTERLOCAL PW

2014 084 WASHINGTON STATE S 320TH STREET PRESERVATION PROJECT 02/17/15 2022 INTERLOCAL PW

2014 037 KING COUNTY HYLEBOS WATERSHED FISHERIES ASSESSMENT 08/31/14 2020 $31,619.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2014 036 KING COUNTY 2014 WR/R GRANT AGREEMENT (CONTRACT #5637579) 12/31/14 2020 $59,430.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2014 032 WASHINGTON STATE EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT PERFORMANCE GRANT E14-089 08/31/14 2020 $36,793.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2014 026 SEATTLE-KING COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF 
PUBLIC HEALTH

LOCAL HAZARDOUS WASTE MANAGEMENT PROGRAM 12/31/14 2020 $0.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2014 021 STATE OF WASHINGTON FY 2013-15 STORMWATER CAPACITY GRANTS 01/31/15 2021 170,000;  THEY PAY 
US

INTERLOCAL PW

2014 020 WASHINGTON STATE SMALL BUSINESS DEVELOPMENT CENTER 12/31/13 2019 $22,500.00 INTERLOCAL CD
2014 003 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT DOWNTOWN SEWER TRUNK UPGRADE UPON 

COMPLETION
INTERLOCAL PW

2014 001 KING COUNTY COMMUTE TRIP REDUCTION IMPLEMENTATION 2013-2015 06/30/15 2021 $33,646.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2013 238 JOINT HUMAN SERVICES APPLICATION & 
FUNDING PROGRAM

PLANNING, , FUNDING, & IMPLEMENTATION OF A JOINT HUMAN 
SERVICES APPLICATION & FUNDING PROGRAM

ONGOING $750 ANNUALLY INTERLOCAL CD

2013 231 WASHINGTON STATE TARGET ZERO TEAMS MOU (DUI) 09/30/14 2020 $6,528.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2013 230 WASHINGTON STATE TARGET ZERO TEAMS MOU (DUI & SEAT BELTS) 09/30/14 2020 $8,400.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2013 226 ASSOCIATION OF WASHINGTON CITIES INTERLOCAL FOR HEALTH CARE PROGRAM ONGOING INTERLOCAL HR
2013 223 WASHINGTON STATE LAKOTA MIDDLE SCHOOL - 13TH AVE. SIDEWALK CONNECTION 09/16/14 2020 $270,119.00 INTERLOCAL PW
2013 213 WASHINGTON STATE TRANSPORTATION DEMAND MANAGEMENT IMPLEMENTATION 

AGREEMENT (CTR)
06/30/15 2021 $0.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2013 204 SOUTH COUNTY AREA TRANSPORTATION 
BOARD "SCATBD"

2013 - 2014 SOUTH COUNTY TRANSPORTATION AGREEMENT 12/31/17 2023 ANNUAL DUES $100 
PER VOTING 

MEMBER

INTERLOCAL PW

PAGE 8 OF 32 LAST REVISED 9/29/2023



CITY OF FEDERAL WAY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS

2013 185 KING COUNTY REGISTERED SEX OFFENDER (RSO) AGREEMENT FOR 2013 - 2014 06/30/14 2020 $43,637.66 INTERLOCAL PD

2013 183 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT S. 320TH STREET @ 20TH AVE S. WATER QUALITY VAULT 02/17/15 2021 $63,157.50 INTERLOCAL PW

2013 178 WASHINGTON STATE STARTZONE MICROENTERPRISE DEVELOPMENT SERVICES 12/31/13 2019 $50,120.00 INTERLOCAL CD-HS
2013 177 WASHINGTON STATE SMALL BUSINESS DEVELOPMENT CENTER 12/31/13 2019 $22,500.00 INTERLOCAL CD-HS
2013 147 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS IMPROVEMENTS TO SACAJAWEA PARK - MOU 12/31/13 2019 $40,546.60 INTERLOCAL PK
2013 133 WASHINGTON STATE DRUG RECOGNITION EXPERTS (DRE) OVERTIME 06/30/15 2021 TBD INTERLOCAL PD

2013 127 WASHINGTON STATE SACAJAWEA MIDDLE SCHOOL WTSC SCHOOL ZONE FLASHING 
BEACON/LIGHTING PROJECT

06/30/14 2020 $7,500.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2013 124 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT 21ST AVENUE SW @ SW 336TH INTERSECTION IMPROVEMENT UPON 
COMPLETION

THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2013 117 WASHINGTON STATE FEDERAL WAY HIGH SCHOOL AND SACAJAWEA MIDDLE SCHOOL 
PEDESTRIAN CONNECTION

10/20/15 2021 $775,000.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2013 099 WASHINGTON STATE NSP1 CLOSEOUT AGREEMENT 02/01/26 2032 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL CD

2013 077 CITY OF SEATTLE INTERNET CRIMES AGAINST CHILDREN TASK FORCE 06/30/16 2022 $0.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2013 072 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS SCHOOL DISTRICT FUELING STATIONS AUTO RENEWS RACK COST PLUS 
$.05/GALLON

INTERLOCAL PW

2013 069 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF 
TRANSPORTATION (WSDOT)

PACIFIC HIGHWAY SOUTH HOV LANES PHASE V  (S 340TH TO S 
359TH ST)

UPON 
COMPLETION

THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2013 054 WASHINGTON STATE S 320TH STREET (11TH PL S TO I-5 LIMITED ACCESS) PRESERVATION 
PROJECT

02/17/15 2021 $1,100,000.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2013 043 CITIES OF AUBURN, BLACK DIAMOND AND DES 
MOINES

TIBURON TO SPILLMAN INTERFACE 12/31/13 2019 $37,777.50 INTERLOCAL IT

2013 034 SEATTLE-KING COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF 
PUBLIC HEALTH

LOCAL HAZARDOUS WASTE MANAGEMENT PROGRAM 12/31/13 2019 $32,861.64 INTERLOCAL PW

2013 022 KING COUNTY CDBG INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT - TRANSFER OF UNOBLIGATED 
GRANT FUNDS TO THE CITY (HUD)

PERMANENT PERMANENT $349,420.00 INTERLOCAL CD

2013 020 PIERCE COUNTY TRAINING RESOURCE & INFORMATION NETWORK (TRAIN) 
AGREEMENT

ONGOING ONGOING $0.00 INTERLOCAL IT

2013 015 KING COUNTY JAIL SERVICES 2012 - 2020 12/31/20 2026 INTERLOCAL PD

2012 157 SEATTLE-KING COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF 
PUBLIC HEALTH

MEDICAID ADMINISTRATIVE MATCH REIMBURSEMENT TO BIRTH TO 
THREE

12/31/12 2018 $22,000.00 INTERLOCAL CD

2012 153 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS STORMING THE SOUND WITH SALMON 12/31/13 2019 $26,387.50 INTERLOCAL PW
2012 149 WASHINGTON STATE CITY WIDE SAFETY IMPROVEMENT PROJECT 03/17/15 2021 $683,029.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2012 148 WASHINGTON STATE SR 99 - S 320TH STREET TO S 330TH STREET SAFETY IMPROVEMENT 
PROJECT

UPON 
COMPLETION

TBD $174,000.00 INTERLOCAL PW

PAGE 9 OF 32 LAST REVISED 9/29/2023



CITY OF FEDERAL WAY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS

2012 147 WASHINGTON STATE S 320TH STREET - SR 99 TO I-5 SAFETY IMPROVEMENT PROJECT UPON 
COMPLETION

TBD $288,771.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2012 140 WASHINGTON STATE PUBLIC DEFENSE GRANT 2013 - CASE TRACKING SYSTEM 12/31/14 2020 $23,000.00 INTERLOCAL MAYOR

2012 137 AUBURN, FEDERAL WAY, KENT, RENTON, 
TUKWILA AND PORT OF SEATTLE

NON-PARTICIPATING JURISDICTION & VALLEY SPECIAL WEAPONS 
AND TACTICS TEAM (SWAT) AGREEMENT FOR SERVICES

ONGOING ONGOING INTERLOCAL PD

2012 136 WASHINGTON STATE SW 312TH AT DASH POINT ROAD INTERSECTION IMPROVEMENTS UPON 
COMPLETION

TBD $7,500.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2012 135 WASHINGTON STATE I-5 SB 320TH STREET OFF-RAMP PLANT ESTABLISHMENT 11/30/14 2020 $21,992.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2012 131 WASHINGTON STATE EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT PERFORMANCE GRANT 2012 08/31/13 2019 $37,154.00 INTERLOCAL PW
2012 130 KING COUNTY REIMBURSEMENT AGREEMENT - KIDNAPPING AND SEX OFFENDER 

REGISTRY
06/30/13 2019 $44,144.89 INTERLOCAL PD

2012 118 WASHINGTON STATE COORDINATED PREVENTION GRANT - GRANT NO. G1300002 06/30/13 2019 $0.00 INTERLOCAL PW
2012 094 WASHINGTON STATE SMALL BUSINESS DEVELOPMENT CENTER 12/31/12 2018 $22,500.00 INTERLOCAL CD

2012 089 WASHINGTON STATE "STORMING THE SOUND WITH SALMON" AKA "SALMON IN SCHOOLS" 
2012 MUNICIPAL STORMWATER GRANTS OF REGIONAL OR 
STATEWIDE SIGNIFICANCE

06/30/13 2019 $73,061.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2012 088 WASHINGTON STATE SMALL BUSINESS DEVELOPMENT CENTER MICROENTERPRISE 
DEVELOPMENT SERVICES

12/31/12 2018 $22,500.00 INTERLOCAL CD

2012 086 WASHINGTON STATE STARTZONE MICROENTERPRISE DEVELOPMENT SERVICES 12/31/12 2018 $50,120.00 INTERLOCAL CD

2012 071 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS MONUMENT SIGN IN LAKOTA PARK 05/31/22 2028 $0.00 INTERLOCAL PK

2012 067 VALLEY REGIONAL FIRE AUTHORITY UNDERWATER TRAINING EVENT 06/15/12 2018 $0.00 INTERLOCAL PK

2012 060 WASHINGTON STATE GRANT - SEWER CRITICAL CAPACITY PROJECT (PWTF) [WITH 
LAKEHAVEN]

12/01/14 2020 $1,500,000.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2012 059 KING COUNTY REGIONAL AFFORDABLE HOUSING PROGRAM INTERLOCAL AGMT 12/31/14 2020 INTERLOCAL CD

2012 038 KING COUNTY 2012 REGIONAL AERIAL MAPPING FUNDING AGREEMENT 12/31/14 2020 $12,543.00 INTERLOCAL IT

2012 035 WASHINGTON STATE 2012 RECYCLING EVENT LEASE 09/15/12 2018 $400.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2012 034 KING COUNTY COMMUTE TRIP REDUCTION IMPLEMENTATION 2011-2013 06/30/13 2019 $33,646.00 INTERLOCAL PW
2012 033 KING COUNTY 2012-2013 REDUCTION/RECYCLING GRANT AGREEMENT 12/31/13 2019 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW
2012 031 WASHINGTON STATE PATROL SECTOR - PROSECUTION (E-TICKET) UPON WRITTEN 

90 DAY NOTICE
ONGOING $0.00 INTERLOCAL LAW

2012 030 CHELAN COUNTY JAIL CONTRACT RENEWAL 12/31/12 2018 SEE FEE SCHEDULE INTERLOCAL PD

2012 026 CITY OF ENUMCLAW JAIL CONTRACT RENEWAL 12/31/12 2018 SEE FEE SCHEDULE INTERLOCAL PD

2012 009 WASHINGTON STATE SMALL BUSINESS DEVELOPMENT CENTER ONGOING $22,500.00 INTERLOCAL CD

2012 007 WASHINGTON STATE COORDINATED PREVENTION GRANT 2012-2013 06/30/13 2019 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

PAGE 10 OF 32 LAST REVISED 9/29/2023



CITY OF FEDERAL WAY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS

2011 212 SEATTLE-KING COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF 
PUBLIC HEALTH

2012 LOCAL HAZARDOUS WASTE MANAGEMENT PROGRAM 12/31/12 2018 $0.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2011 206 WASHINGTON STATE 2011-2013 CTR AGREEMENT (GCA 6888) 06/30/13 2019 $38,869.00 INTERLOCAL PW
2011 203 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT, SOUTH KING 

FIRE DISTRICT, FEDERAL WAY SCHOOL 
DISTRICT AND ST. FRANCIS HOSPITAL

ESTABLISHING THE GREATER FEDERAL WAY EMERGENCY 
MANAGEMENT OVERSIGHT COMMITTEE

12/31/15 2021 $0.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2011 202 WASHINGTON STATE COMMUNITY PATHWAYS & INCLUSION COORDINATOR 12/31/11 2017 $23,430.75 INTERLOCAL PK

2011 193 SOUTH COUNTY CORRECTIONAL FACILITY 
(SCORE)

INVESTIGATIVE ASSISTANCE AGREEMENT ONGOING ONGOING $0.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2011 192 U.S. FEDERAL GOVERNMENT MOA DEFINING USE OF FWPD RADIO FREQUENCIES ONGOING ONGOING $0.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2011 189 WASHINGTON STATE EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT PERFORMANCE GRANT (EMPG) 2011 06/30/12 2018 $37,072.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2011 186 PENINSULA METROPOLITAN PARK DISTRICT 
(PENMET PARKS)

PORTABLE STAGE LOAN 10/12/11 2017 $0.00 INTERLOCAL PK

2011 185 WASHINGTON STATE (GCA 6888 LAG )TRANSPORTATION DEMAND MANAGEMENT 
IMPLEMENTATION AGREEMENT

06/30/13 2019 $38,869.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2011 184 WASHINGTON STATE MARK TWAIN SCHOOL SAFE ROUTES TO SCHOOL PROJECT (LAG 
#7572)

04/16/13 2019 $386,057.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2011 183 WASHINGTON STATE LAKOTA MIDDLE SCHOOL SAFE ROUTES TO SCHOOL PROJECT (LAG 
#7573)

01/06/15 2021 $859,080.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2011 181 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS SCHOOL RESOURCE OFFICERS 12/31/16 AUTO RENEWAL THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PD

2011 169 KING COUNTY CDBG 2011 12/31/11 2062 INTERLOCAL CD-HS

2011 164 KING COUNTY KC RSO GRANT FUNDING COST REIMBURSEMENT AGREEMENT 06/30/12 2018 $34,956.88 INTERLOCAL PD

2011 161 WASHINGTON STATE NSP3 - WESTWAY NEIGHBORHOOD HOUSING PROJECT 03/08/14 2029 $1,693,000.00 INTERLOCAL MAYOR

2011 157 KING COUNTY HOME INVESTMENT PARTNERSHIP PROGRAM 12/31/14 2020 INTERLOCAL MAYOR

2011 155 WASHINGTON STATE SHERWOOD FOREST ELEMENTARY - WTSC SCHOOL ZONE FLASHING 
BEACON/LIGHTING PROJECT

11/23/09 2015
ARCHIVE

THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2011 154 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF 
ECOLOGY

S. 356TH STREET RDF RETROFIT PROJECT - GRANT ACCEPTANCE 12/31/14 2020 $886,618.84 INTERLOCAL PW

2011 149 WASHINGTON STATE SHERWOOD FOREST ELEMENTARY - WTSC SCHOOL ZONE FLASHING 
BEACONS RETROFITS

10/28/11 2017 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2011 148 WASHINGTON STATE ENTERPRISE ELEMENTARY - WTSC SCHOOL ZONE FLASHING 
BEACONS RETROFITS

10/28/11 2017 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2011 147 WASHINGTON STATE OLYMPIC VIEW ELEMENTARY - WTSC SCHOOL ZONE FLASHING 
BEACONS RETROFITS

10/28/11 2017 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

PAGE 11 OF 32 LAST REVISED 9/29/2023



CITY OF FEDERAL WAY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS

2011 146 WASHINGTON STATE MIRROR LAKE ELEMENTARY - WTSC SCHOOL ZONE FLASHING 
BEACONS RETROFITS

10/28/11 2017 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2011 145 WASHINGTON STATE LAKE GROVE ELEMENTARY - WTSC SCHOOL ZONE FLASHING 
BEACONS RETROFITS

10/28/11 2017 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2011 144 WASHINGTON STATE MARK TWAIN ELEMENTARY - WTSC SCHOOL ZONE FLASHING 
BEACONS RETROFITS

10/28/11 2017 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2011 143 WASHINGTON STATE GREEN GABLES ELEMENTARY - WTSC SCHOOL ZONE FLASHING 
BEACONS RETROFITS

10/28/11 2017 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2011 142 WASHINGTON STATE PANTHER LAKE ELEMENTARY - WTSC SCHOOL ZONE FLASHING 
BEACONS RETROFITS

10/28/11 2017 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2011 141 WASHINGTON STATE TWIN LAKES ELEMENTARY - WTSC SCHOOL ZONE FLASHING 
BEACONS RETROFITS

10/28/11 2017 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2011 140 WASHINGTON STATE NAUTILUS ELEMENTARY - WTSC SCHOOL ZONE FLASHING BEACONS 
RETROFITS

10/28/11 2017 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2011 139 WASHINGTON STATE BRIGADOON ELEMENTARY - WTSC SCHOOL ZONE FLASHING 
BEACONS RETROFITS

10/28/11 2017 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2011 116 WASHINGTON TRAFFIC SAFETY COMMISSION SILVER LAKE ELEMENTARY WTSC SCHOOL ZONE FLASHING BEACON 05/20/11 2017 INTERLOCAL PW

2011 113 WASHINGTON STATE FIBER  OPTIC CABLE INSTALLATION - SOUTH 320TH STREET AT SR 
99

09/30/20 2026 $0.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2011 111 KING COUNTY KING COUNTY I-NET (INSTITUTIONAL NETWORK SERVICES - 
CONTRACT NO. 01COFW11)

12/13/13 2019 $32,085.00 INTERLOCAL MAYOR

2011 108 WASHINGTON STATE ADOBE PRODUCT PURCHASE AGREEMENT 12/31/16 2022 $0.00 INTERLOCAL MAYOR

2011 098 SEATTLE-KING COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF 
PUBLIC HEALTH

SOUTH KING COUNTY MOBILE MEDICAL PROGRAM 12/31/12 2018 $20,000.00 INTERLOCAL MAYOR

2011 097 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF ECOLOGY 06/30/14 2020 $0.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2011 088 KING COUNTY SPECIAL USE PERMIT S-187-10 TO INSTALL AND MAINTAIN GATE ON 
AN EXISTING FENCE LOCATED ON A KING COUNTY PARK & RIDE 
FACILITY

ONGOING ONGOING INTERLOCAL PW

2011 082 WASHINGTON STATE I-5 S 320TH STREET SOUTHBOUND OFF RAMP - CONSTRUCTION 
MANAGEMENT (#156)

01/02/13 2019 $472,530.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2011 067 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT HYLEBOS WATER SERVICE CONNECTION (EASEMENT) ONGOING ONGOING $18,621.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2011 039 WASHINGTON STATE RECYCLING EVENTS - 2011 09/17/11 2017 $400.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2011 022 WASHINGTON STATE 21ST AVE SW AT SW 336TH INTERSECTION IMPROVEMENTS 12/31/12 2018 $3,360,000.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2011 016 SEATTLE-KING COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF 
PUBLIC HEALTH

LOCAL HAZARDOUS WASTE MANAGEMENT PROGRAM 12/31/11 2017 THEY PAY US INTERLOCAL PW

2011 011 WASHINGTON STATE COMMUNITY HEALTH & SAFETY FAIR - VENDOR 01/22/11 2017 $0.00 INTERLOCAL PK

2011 005 KING COUNTY MULTI-JURISDICTIONAL MITIGATION PLAN LETTER OF AGREEMENT ONGOING ONGOING $0.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2010 179 WASHINGTON STATE SMALL BUSINESS DEVELOPMENT CENTER 12/31/10 2016
ARCHIVE

$22,500.00 INTERLOCAL MAYOR

PAGE 12 OF 32 LAST REVISED 9/29/2023



CITY OF FEDERAL WAY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS

2010 177 WASHINGTON STATE FEDERAL WAY URBAN INFRASTRUCTURE PROJECT 12/31/20 2026 $5,475,000.00 INTERLOCAL MAYOR

2010 170 CITY OF FIFE INMATE JAIL SERVICES 07/01/11 2017 PER INMATE FEES - 
SEE SECT. 6

INTERLOCAL PD

2010 169 CHELAN COUNTY INMATE JAIL SERVICES 10/31/11 2017 PER INMATE FEES - 
SEE SECT. 6

INTERLOCAL PD

2010 166 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF 
CORRECTIONS (DOC)

WORK CREW CONTRACT 06/30/24 2030 INTERLOCAL MC

2010 157 KING COUNTY CDBG 2010 12/31/10 2061 $163,214.00 INTERLOCAL CD

2010 156 KING COUNTY PERMIT FOR PLACEMENT OF BALLOT DROP BOX 09/15/11 2017 $0.00 INTERLOCAL PK

2010 155 AUBURN, FEDERAL WAY, KENT, RENTON, 
TUKWILA AND PORT OF SEATTLE

VALLEY SPECIAL WEAPONS AND TACTICS TEAM (SWAT) ONGOING ONGOING INTERLOCAL PD

2010 154 WASHINGTON STATE 2011 MUNICIPAL STORMWATER CAPACITY GRANT 06/30/13 2019 $354,628.00 INTERLOCAL PW
2010 147 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT S 352ND STREET EXTENSION PROJECT (SR 161 TO SR 99) 10/17/17 2023 $14,155.99 INTERLOCAL PW

2010 146 KING COUNTY REGISTERED SEX OFFENDER GRANT 06/30/11 2017 $33,613.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2010 130 WASHINGTON STATE VEHICLE INSPECTION AGREEMENT 07/31/16 2022 $0.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2010 124 WASHINGTON STATE CITY HALL HVAC SYSTEM (STATE ENERGY PROGRAM - AMERICAN 
RECOVER & REINVESTMENT ACT [ARRA] 2009)

12/31/11 2017 $323,237.00 INTERLOCAL MAYOR

2010 113 WASHINGTON STATE SHARED RESOURCE CONSERVATION MANAGER - GRANT 04/30/12 2018 $75,000.00 INTERLOCAL MAYOR

2010 102 WASHINGTON STATE EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT PERFORMANCE GRANT 03/31/11 2017 $34,370.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2010 097 WASHINGTON STATE DAPS - DISCLOSURE DRIVER AND PLATE SEARCH DATA 07/31/12 2018 SEE FEE SCHEDULE INTERLOCAL CD

2010 095 WASHINGTON STATE RESPITE CARE, COMMUNITY SETTINGS 03/31/13 2019 SEE FEE SCHEDULE INTERLOCAL PK

2010 080 CITY OF BUCKLEY JAIL SERVICES 12/31/11 2017 TBD INTERLOCAL PD

2010 076 CITY OF ENUMCLAW JAIL SERVICES 12/31/11 2017 SEE FEE SCHEDULE INTERLOCAL PD

2010 074 CITY OF SEATTLE EDWARD BYRNE MEMORIAL JUSTICE ASSISTANT (JAG) GRANT 
PROGRAM FY09

09/30/12 2018 $49,431.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2010 073 CITY OF AUBURN JAIL SERVICES 12/31/11 2017 TBD INTERLOCAL PD

2010 068 WASHINGTON STATE I-5 S 320TH STREET SOUTHBOUND OFF RAMP 01/02/13 2019 $372,000.00 INTERLOCAL PW
2010 066 CITY OF AUBURN RESOURCE CONSERVATION MANAGER PROGRAM 04/30/12 2018 SEE CONTRACT INTERLOCAL MAYOR

2010 065 WASHINGTON STATE DUMAS BAY SALTWATER ALGAE RESEARCH - GRANT G1000519 06/30/11 2017 $11,655.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2010 064 WASHINGTON STATE DUMAS BAY SALTWATER ALGAE RESEARCH - GRANT G1000518 06/30/11 2017 $11,655.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2010 059 FIBER CONSORTIUM FIBER CONSORTIUM 02/01/30 2036 $0.00 INTERLOCAL IT

PAGE 13 OF 32 LAST REVISED 9/29/2023



CITY OF FEDERAL WAY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS

2010 051 KING COUNTY WASTE REDUCTION AND RECYCLING GRANT 2010-2011 12/31/11 2017 $0.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2010 048 WASHINGTON STATE COOPERATIVE PROCUREMENT AGREEMENT ONGOING ONGOING $0.00 INTERLOCAL FI

2010 046 WASHINGTON STATE I-5 S 320TH STREET SOUTHBOUND OFF RAMP 01/02/13 2019 $628,568.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2010 044 WASHINGTON STATE RECYCLING EVENTS - 2010 09/18/10 2016 $400.00 INTERLOCAL PW
2010 040 KING COUNTY RAPID RIDE DESIGN AND CONSTRUCTION 12/31/10 2016

ARCHIVE
INTERLOCAL PW

2010 036 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT S. 348TH STREET AT 1ST AVE. S INTERSECTION IMPROVEMENTS 
(#135)

03/20/13 2019 $114,504.54 INTERLOCAL PW

2010 034 AUBURN, FEDERAL WAY, KENT, RENTON, 
TUKWILA AND PORT OF SEATTLE

VALLEY CIVIL DISTURBANCE UNIT ONGOING $0.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2010 024 WASHINGTON STATE S. 348TH STREET AT 1ST AVE. S INTERSECTION IMPROVEMENTS 
(#135)

07/26/12 2018 $1,222,127.59 INTERLOCAL PW

2010 023 WASHINGTON STATE COORDINATED PREVENTION GRANT 2010-2011 06/30/11 2017 $0.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2010 009 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT WEST HYLEBOS CREEK HEADWATERS RESTORATION UPON 
COMPLETION

TBD INTERLOCAL PW

2010 008 WASHINGTON STATE SMALL BUSINESS DEVELOPMENT CENTER 12/31/09 2015 $22,500.00 INTERLOCAL MAYOR

2010 006 CITY OF AUBURN USE OF CITY FACILITIES - DATA CENTER ONGOING $0.00 INTERLOCAL IT

2010 004 WASHINGTON STATE SURPLUS PROPERTY ONGOING $0.00 INTERLOCAL FI

2009 251 CITY OF TACOMA ELECTRICAL PERMITTING AND INSPECTION SERVICE ONGOING $0.00 INTERLOCAL LAW

2009 250 SOUND TRANSIT POLICE ENHANCEMENTS AT FEDERAL WAY TRANSIT CENTER ONGOING ONGOING $0.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2009 235 KING COUNTY COOPERATIVE PROCUREMENT AGREEMENT ONGOING ONGOING N/A INTERLOCAL FI

2009 229 KING COUNTY REGISTERED SEX OFFENDER GRANT
COST REIMBURSEMENT AGREEMENT

06/30/10 2016
ARCHIVE

$92,700.46 INTERLOCAL PD

2009 228 CITY OF SEATTLE GANG ANALYST GRANT 06/30/10 2016
ARCHIVE

$34,117.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2009 227 CITY OF SEATTLE JUSTICE ASSISTANCE GRANT (JAG) 02/28/13 2019 $183,079.00 INTERLOCAL PD
2009 218 VALLEY NARCOTICS ENFORCEMENT  TEAM DEA TASK FORCE 06/09/22 ONGOING $0.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2009 216 WASHINGTON STATE PHASE 2 STORMWATER PASS-THROUGH GRANT PROGRAM 06/30/11 2017 $50,000.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2009 215 KING COUNTY COMMUTE TRIP REDUCTION PROGRAM IMPLEMENTATION 
AGREEMENT 2009-2011

06/30/11 2017 $1,600.00 INTERLOCAL PW

PAGE 14 OF 32 LAST REVISED 9/29/2023



CITY OF FEDERAL WAY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS

2009 214 UNITED STATES STATE AND LOCAL HIDTA TASK FORCE AGREEMENT 09/30/10 2016
ARCHIVE

$16,903.25 INTERLOCAL PD

2009 209 WASHINGTON STATE DOWNPYAMENT ASSISTANCE HOUSE KEY FEDERAL WAY ONGOING ONGOING $651,688.00 INTERLOCAL CD

2009 208 SOUTH COUNTY AREA TRANSPORTATION 
BOARD "SCATBD"

2009 - 2012 SOUTH COUNTY TRANSPORTATION AGREEMENT 
(PLANNING AGREEMENT)

12/31/12 2018 $0.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2009 207 WASHINGTON STATE COMMUTE TRIP REDUCTION AGREEMENT GCA6241 (2009 - 2011) 06/30/11 2017 $0.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2009 206 WASHINGTON STATE PACIFIC HWY S HOV LANES PHASE IV - REGIONAL MOBILITY GRANT 
AGREEMENT NO. GCA 6130  (#159)

01/02/13 2019 $0.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2009 186 WASHINGTON STATE FEMA 1825 GRANT - SEVERE WINTER STORM AND RECORD AND NEAR 
RECORD SNOW EVENT DECEMBER 12, 2008 TO JANUARY 5, 2009

03/01/13 2019 $0.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2009 183 CITY OF BELLEVUE SCORE - JAG PROCEEDS DISTRIBUTION &  HOLD HARMLESS PERMANENT PERMANENT $592,399.79 INTERLOCAL MAYOR

2009 182 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT PHASE IV HOV LANES - LAKEHAVEN EASEMENTS - SETTLEMENT 
AGREEMENT  (#159)

12/31/14 2020 REASONABLE COSTS INTERLOCAL LAW

2009 181 WASHINGTON STATE NSP GRANT AGREEMENT 03/31/13 2019 $651,688.00 INTERLOCAL CD
2009 177 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT WATER QUALITY MONITORING STATION 12/31/29 2035 INTERLOCAL PW
2009 176 KING COUNTY CDGB - 2009 08/31/12 2018 $1,093,453.00 INTERLOCAL CD
2009 166 KING COUNTY ORCA CARD PURCHASE 09/30/10 2016

ARCHIVE
$13,134.24 INTERLOCAL PW

2009 160 WASHINGTON STATE FALL RECYCLING EVENT - 2009 09/19/09 2015 $200.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2009 159 SOUTH COUNTY CORRECTIONAL FACILITY 
(SCORE)

SOUTH COUNTY CORRECTIONAL FACILITY (SCORE) 02/25/24 2025 INTERLOCAL MAYOR

2009 147 WASHINGTON STATE AUTOMATED LICENSE PLATE READER MOU ONGOING ONGOING INTERLOCAL PD
2009 138 KING COUNTY KING COUNTY FLOOD ZONE AGREEMENT ONGOING ONGOING $0.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2009 129 WASHINGTON STATE FEMA 1817 GRANT - SEVER WINTER STORMS 2009 EVENT 01/29/13 2019 $0.00 INTERLOCAL PW
2009 093 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS SCHOOL RESOURCE OFFICERS 08/31/10 2016 $321,592.00 INTERLOCAL PD
2009 082 CITY OF SEATTLE GANG RELATED CRIME 06/30/09 2015 $5,000.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2009 058 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT WITH FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS UPON 
COMPLETION

TBD $0.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2009 050 NRDA & NOAA OFFICE OF GENERAL COUNSEL 
GCNR/NW
(NATIONAL RESOURCE DAMAGE ASSESSMENT)

NRDA - WEST HYLEBOS CREEK HABITAT ONGOING ONGOING $0.00 INTERLOCAL PW

PAGE 15 OF 32 LAST REVISED 9/29/2023



CITY OF FEDERAL WAY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS

2009 047 WASHINGTON STATE 2009 SPRING RECYCLE EVENT LEASE 03/21/09 2015 $200.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2009 030 KING COUNTY RSO GRANT (COST REIMBURSEMENT AGREEMENT) 06/30/09 $53,321.58 INTERLOCAL PD

2009 013 CITY OF SEATTLE D.V. PROSECUTION COORDINATION THROUGH CO-LOCATION 
PROJECT

08/31/13 2019 INTERLOCAL LAW

2009 007 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT S 356TH ST AT SR 99 INTERSECTION IMPROVEMENTS 04/06/10 2016 INTERLOCAL PW
2008 173 WASHINGTON STATE DAPS - DISCLOSURE DRIVER AND PLATE SEARCH DATA 07/06/10 2016 SEE FEE SCHEDULE INTERLOCAL CD
2008 163 WASHINGTON STATE 2008 FALL RECYCLE EVENT 09/27/08 2014 $200.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2008 153 WASHINGTON STATE 2009 PUBLIC FLEET CLEAN DIESEL GRANT 06/30/09 2015 $12,156.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2008 129 KING COUNTY COMMUTE TRIP REDUCTION IMPLEMENTATION 06/30/09 2015 $24,548.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2008 125 KING CO. METRO, PIERCE TRANSIT, SOUND 
TRANSIT

CITY HALL AREA FLEXPASS 08/31/09 2015 $13,462.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2008 123 WASHINGTON STATE INTERAGENCY AGREEMENT -INTERPRETER SERVICES 09/30/09 2015 $0.00 INTERLOCAL MC

2008 115 WASHINGTON STATE PAC PRECONSTRUCTION ACTIVITIES 06/30/11 2017 $493,750.00 INTERLOCAL MAYOR

2008 107 WASHINGTON STATE SMALL BUSINESS DEVELOPMENT CENTER 12/31/09 2015 $26,250.00 INTERLOCAL MAYOR

2008 106 WASHINGTON STATE ECOLOGY FUNDING TO REMOVE EXCESS SEAWEED (SEA LETTUCE) 
FROM DUMAS BAY

12/31/08 2014 -$50,000.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2008 101 KING COUNTY 2008 LEVY FUNDS 12/31/14 2020 $0.00 INTERLOCAL PK

2008 088 KING COUNTY CDBG BLOCK GRANT PROGRAM 2009 (JOINT INTERLOCAL 
AGREEMENT)

12/31/11 2062 TBD BY ANNUAL 
AGREEMENT

INTERLOCAL CD

2008 084 KING COUNTY 2008 JOINT AGREEMENT - CDBG) SEE RETENTION 
DATE

2059 $171,954.00 INTERLOCAL CD

2008 049 SEATTLE-KING COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF 
PUBLIC HEALTH

LOCAL HAZARDOUS WASTE MANAGEMENT PROGRAM 12/31/10 2016 INTERLOCAL PW

2008 047 KING COUNTY REGIONAL AFFORDABLE HOUSING PROGRAM INTERLOCAL AGMT 12/31/11 2017 $0.00 INTERLOCAL CD

2008 043 KING COUNTY SOLID WASTE DIVISION WASTE REDUCTION AND RECYCLING 
PROGRAM 2008-2009

12/31/09 2015 $0.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2008 034 CENTRAL PUGET SOUND REGIONAL TRANSIT 
AUTHORITY

LAW ENFORCEMENT SERVICE AGREEMENT - FEDERAL WAY TRANSIT 
CENTER

12/31/08 2014 INTERLOCAL PD

2008 033 KING COUNTY PARK & RIDE USE PERMIT FOR RECYCLING EVENT 03/16/08 2014 $0.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2008 025 WASHINGTON STATE COORDINATED PREVENTION GRANT 2008-2009 12/31/09 2015 $0.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2008 018 WASHINGTON STATE S. 356TH STREET AT SR 99 INTERSECTION 04/06/10 2016 $4,350,533.00 INTERLOCAL PW
2007 192 KING COUNTY MOU - DISASTER RELIEF SUPPLIES - PLACEMENT, MAINT & CARE ONGOING ONGOING $0.00 INTERLOCAL PW

PAGE 16 OF 32 LAST REVISED 9/29/2023



CITY OF FEDERAL WAY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS

2007 189 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT OFFICE SPACE OCCUPANCY AUTO RENEWAL 2023 INTERLOCAL PW

2007 188 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF 
ECOLOGY

WATER QUALITY PROGRAM:  FW LOCAL GOVERNMENT STORMWATER 
GRANT

06/30/09 2015 $75,000.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2007 187 SAN JUAN COUNTY INTERLOCAL BIDDING/PURCHASING AGREEMENT ONGOING ONGOING $0.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2007 185 WASHINGTON STATE COMMUTE TRIP REDUCTION AGREEMENT GCA5387 06/30/09 2015 $56,451.94 INTERLOCAL PW

2007 184 KING COUNTY ARTS SUSTAINED SUPPORT PROGRAM 12/31/07 2013 -$15,000.00 INTERLOCAL PK

2007 179 CITY OF SEATTLE INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT ONGOING ONGOING INTERLOCAL PW
2007 178 KING COUNTY COMMUTE TRIP REDUCTION IMPLEMENTATION 06/30/08 2014 $23,069.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2007 177 WASHINGTON STATE CITY CENTER ACCESS PROJECT PHASE II (CCAP) 12/31/10 2016 $150,000.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2007 176 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT PACIFIC HWY SOUTH HOV LANES PHASE IV (S 312TH TO DASH PT 
RD)  (#159)

01/02/13 2019 $1,361,643.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2007 171 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT S 348TH ST HOV LANES (9TH AVE S TO SR99) (#138) 03/17/09 2015 INTERLOCAL PW

2007 165 KING CO. METRO, PIERCE TRANSIT, SOUND 
TRANSIT

CITY HALL AREA FLEX PASS 08/31/08 2014 $11,200.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2007 164 KING COUNTY PARK & RIDE USE PERMIT FOR RECYCLING EVENT 09/29/07 2013 $0.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2007 160 PUGET SOUND EDUCATIONAL SERVICE 
DISTRICT

FUNDING FOR REINVESTING IN YOUTH 12/31/07 2013 $5,000.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2007 141 AUBURN, DES MOINES, FEDERAL WAY, KENT, 
RENTON, TUKWILA & PORT OF SEATTLE

INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT - CREATION OF THE VALLEY SPECIAL 
RESPONSE TEAM

ONGOING ONGOING $0.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2007 140 DES MOINES, FEDERAL WAY, TUKWILA & 
PREGNANCY AID OF SOUTH KING COUNTY

INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT - CRISIS PREGNANCY AID 12/31/08 2014 $9,000.00 INTERLOCAL CD

2007 109 KING COUNTY 2007 CDBG CONTRACT 12/31/07 2013 $171,954.00 INTERLOCAL CD

2007 107 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS TRANSFER OF KENNETH JONES POOL PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL PK
2007 105 CENTRAL PUGET SOUND REGIONAL TRANSIT 

AUTHORITY
LAW ENFORCEMENT SERVICE AGREEMENT - FEDERAL WAY TRANSIT 
CENTER

12/31/07 2013 INTERLOCAL PD

2007 093 WASHINGTON STATE INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY PURCHASE PRIMARY AGREEMENT ONGOING ONGOING $0.00 INTERLOCAL IT

2007 045 WASHINGTON STATE S 348TH ST HOV LANES (9TH AVE S TO SR99) (#138) 03/17/09 2015 INTERLOCAL PW

2007 035 KING COUNTY PARK & RIDE USE PERMIT FOR RECYCLING EVENT 03/17/07 2013 INTERLOCAL PW

2007 031 CITY OF AUBURN BOUNDARY MOU PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL CD
2007 030 WASHINGTON STATE EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT GRANT FOR POLICE DEPT 04/30/07 2013 $46,500.00 INTERLOCAL PD

PAGE 17 OF 32 LAST REVISED 9/29/2023



CITY OF FEDERAL WAY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS

2007 013 SEATTLE-KING COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF 
PUBLIC HEALTH

LOCAL HAZARDOUS WASTE MANAGEMENT PROGRAM 12/31/07 2013 INTERLOCAL PW

2007 011 CITY OF FEDERAL WAY FEDERAL WAY COMMUNITY CENTER (FWCC) LIMITED USE 
AGREEMENT

02/28/07 2013 INTERLOCAL PK

2007 004 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT 21ST AVE SW EXTENSION ILA 12/18/07 2013 INTERLOCAL PW
2006 153 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS SCHOOL RESOURCE OFFICERS 08/31/08 2014 INTERLOCAL PD
2006 151 WASHINGTON STATE SPRING VALLEY RESTORATION & S 373RD ST BRIDGE REPLACEMENT 12/31/08 2014 INTERLOCAL PW

2006 149 WRIA 9 WATERSHED FORUM INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT 12/31/15 2021 INTERLOCAL PW

2006 143 CITY OF FEDERAL WAY CONTRACT INSPECTIONS FOR QUADRANT CORP 04/24/07 2013 INTERLOCAL CD

2006 129 KING CO. METRO, PIERCE TRANSIT, SOUND 
TRANSIT

CITY HALL AREA FLEXPASS 08/31/07 2013 INTERLOCAL PW

2006 128 CITY OF FEDERAL WAY 2006 FALL SPECIAL RECYCLING EVENT 09/30/06 2012 INTERLOCAL PW
2006 122 WASHINGTON STATE 21ST AVE SW EXTENSION (SW 356TH ST TO 22ND AVE SW) 12/18/07 2013 INTERLOCAL PW
2006 117 WASHINGTON STATE LAG:  NON-DISCRIMINATION AGREEMENT PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL LAW
2006 114 KING COUNTY COMMUTE TRIP REDUCTION IMPLEMENTATION 06/30/07 2013 INTERLOCAL PW

2006 104 WASHINGTON STATE PACIFIC HIGHWAY S HOV LANES PHASE III - S 284TH ST TO DASH 
POINT (#141)

04/06/10 2016 INTERLOCAL PW

2006 096 WASHINGTON STATE SMALL BUSINESS DEVELOPMENT CENTER 12/31/07 2013 INTERLOCAL MAYOR

2006 091 SOUTH KING FIRE & RESCUE DISTRICT USE OF TECHNICAL RESCUE TRAILER 06/09/22 ONGOING INTERLOCAL PD

2006 084 OKANOGAN COUNTY ILA BETWEEN OKANOGAN CO, CFW, AND WA FOR THE HOUSING OF 
INMATES IN THE OKANOGAN COUNTY JAIL

06/09/22 ONGOING INTERLOCAL PD

2006 079 KING COUNTY JOE'S CREEK SALMON HABITAT RESTORATION PROJECT 12/31/06 2012 INTERLOCAL PW
2006 078 KING COUNTY 2006 CDBG 12/31/06 2062 INTERLOCAL CD
2006 071 CITY OF FIFE HOUSING OF INMATES IN FIFE JAIL 12/31/09 2015 INTERLOCAL PD
2006 063 WASHINGTON STATE KING COUNTY LIBRARY CROSSWALK AND TRANSIT STOP 05/06/06 2012 INTERLOCAL PW
2006 062 WASHINGTON STATE Administrative Office of the Courts - Certified Law Enforcement 

Agencies
05/19/06 2012 INTERLOCAL FI

2006 061 WASHINGTON STATE West Campus Trail - BPA Trail Spur 05/08/06 2012 INTERLOCAL PW
2006 057 WASHINGTON STATE ADMINISTRATIVE OFFICE OF THE COURTS - PROSECUTOR ONGOING ONGOING INTERLOCAL FI
2006 049 WASHINGTON STATE SR-5 SPRING VALLEY RESTORATION PRELIMINARY ENGINEERING 12/31/08 2014 INTERLOCAL PW
2006 048 CITY OF TUKWILA CAPACITY PARTNERSHIP PROGRAM (FORMERLY KNOWN AS:  

ORGANIZATIONAL CAPACITY BUILDING PILOT PROGRAM)
08/01/08 2014 $18,295.00 INTERLOCAL CD

2006 043 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT S 373RD ST BRIDGE REPLACEMENT PROJECT @ HYLEBOS CREEK 12/31/08 2014 INTERLOCAL PW

PAGE 18 OF 32 LAST REVISED 9/29/2023



CITY OF FEDERAL WAY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS

2006 037 KING COUNTY TRANSFER OF RECORDS: PW, SWM, JAIL, PS 01/01/10 2016
ARCHIVE

INTERLOCAL LAW

2006 033 KING COUNTY Spring 2006 Special Recycling Event 03/18/06 2012 INTERLOCAL PW
2006 024 WASHINGTON STATE PACIFIC HWY SOUTH HOV LANES PHASE IV  (#159) 01/02/13 2019 $4,291,784.00 INTERLOCAL PW
2006 022 KING COUNTY 2006-2007 WASTE REDUCTION & RECYCLING PROGRAM 12/31/07 2013 INTERLOCAL PW

2006 017 WASHINGTON STATE BUFFER ZONE PROTECTION PLAN E06-241 03/31/06 2012 INTERLOCAL PD
2006 004 CITY OF FEDERAL WAY CP-ARTS SUSTAINED SUPPORT PROGRAM 12/31/06 2012 INTERLOCAL PK
2006 002 WASHINGTON STATE 2006-2007 COORDINATED PREVENTION GRANT 12/31/07 2013 INTERLOCAL PW

2005 193 WASHINGTON STATE FUEL TAX GRANT DISTRIBUTION AGREEMENT - DASH POINT TO S 
312 ST

UPON 
COMPLETION

UPON 
COMPLETION

INTERLOCAL PW

2005 192 SOUTH KING FIRE & RESCUE DISTRICT DEVELOPMENT REVIEW  & ENFORCEMENT OF INTERNATIONAL FIRE 
CODE

ONGOING ONGOING INTERLOCAL CD

2005 189 KING COUNTY WASTE REDUCTION AND RECYCLING PROGRAM 2006-2007 12/31/07 2013 INTERLOCAL PW

2005 187 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT S 336TH ST @1ST WAY S PROJECT WATERLINE REPLACEMENT 07/31/06 2012 INTERLOCAL PW
2005 177 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT PRELIMINARY ENGINEERING SERVICES 12/31/09 2015 $5,000.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2005 174 WASHINGTON STATE COMMUTE TRIP REDUCTION IMPLEMENTATION 06/30/07 2013 INTERLOCAL PW

2005 173 KING COUNTY COMMUTE TRIP REDUCTION IMPLEMENTATION 06/30/06 2012 INTERLOCAL PW
2005 156 CITY OF FEDERAL WAY FALL 2005 SPECIAL RECYCLING EVENT 10/01/05 2011 INTERLOCAL PW
2005 145 KING COUNTY DEVELOPMENTAL DISABILITIES 12/31/05 2011 INTERLOCAL PK
2005 131 LAKEHAVEN, FEDERAL WAY FIRE DISTRICT, 

FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
GREATER FEDERAL WAY EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT COMMITTEE 12/31/15 2021 INTERLOCAL PW

2005 119 KING COUNTY JOINT INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT REGARDING THE CDBG PROGRAM 10/27/08 2056 INTERLOCAL CD

2005 117 KING COUNTY 2005 CDBG CONTRACT 12/31/05 2061 INTERLOCAL CD
2005 108 PUBLIC HEALTH - SEATTLE AND KING COUNTY BIRTH TO THREE MEDICAID ADMINISTRATIVE MATCH PROGRAM 12/31/05 2011 INTERLOCAL CD

2005 106 WASHINGTON STATE WATER QUALITY PROGRAM - AQUATIC WEEDS MANAGEMENT 12/31/11 2017 INTERLOCAL PW

2005 102 KING CO. METRO, PIERCE TRANSIT, SOUND 
TRANSIT

FEDERAL WAY CITY HALL AREA FLEXPASS 04/30/06 2012 INTERLOCAL PW

2005 099 WASHINGTON STATE VEHICLE AND VESSEL RECORD INFORMATION 06/14/07 2013 INTERLOCAL MC

2005 095 CITY OF FEDERAL WAY EVIDENCE BUILDING LIMITED ACCESS AGREEMENT 12/31/05 2012 INTERLOCAL MAYOR
2005 088 WASHINGTON STATE HAN WOO RI FESTIVAL INTERAGENCY AGMT 06/30/05 2011 INTERLOCAL MAYOR
2005 068 WASHINGTON STATE 2005 STEEL LAKE & NORTH LAKE NOXIOUS WEED PERMITS 12/31/05 2011 INTERLOCAL PW
2005 038 KING COUNTY REGIONAL AFFORDABLE HOUSING PROGRAM INTERLOCAL AGMT 12/31/06 2012 INTERLOCAL CD
2005 029 KING COUNTY PERMIT PROCESSING IN ANNEXATION AREAS ONGOING INTERLOCAL CD
2005 023 KING COUNTY 2005 SPRING RECYCLE EVENT 03/31/05 2011 INTERLOCAL PW

PAGE 19 OF 32 LAST REVISED 9/29/2023



CITY OF FEDERAL WAY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS

2005 019 WASHINGTON STATE COMMUNITY CORRECTIONS OFFICERS INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT ONGOING INTERLOCAL PD

2005 010 WASHINGTON STATE TURNBACK AGREEMENT TB 1-0172  S 317TH ST HOV DIRECT ACCESS ONGOING INTERLOCAL PW

2005 009 KING COUNTY SUBGRANT AGREEMENT FOR EOC EQUIPMENT 10/01/05 2011 INTERLOCAL PW
2005 001 SOUTH COUNTY AREA TRANSPORTATION 

BOARD "SCATBD"
2006-2008 ILA 12/31/08 2014 INTERLOCAL PW

2004 200 KING COUNTY HOMELAND SECURITY SUBGRANT AGMT - GREATER FW CBRNE 
RESPONSE EQUIPMENT

11/01/05 2011 INTERLOCAL PD

2004 193 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT PACIFIC HIGHWAY SOUTH HOV LANES PH III (#141) 04/06/10 2016 INTERLOCAL PW
2004 192 SOUND TRANSIT FUTURE DEVELOPMENT OF TRANSIT ORIENTED DEVELOPMENT AT 

FW TRANSIT CENTER
ONGOING ONGOING INTERLOCAL LAW

2004 172 CITY OF ENUMCLAW INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT - JAIL SERVICES 07/01/05 2011 INTERLOCAL PD
2004 171 WASHINGTON STATE VIA KING COUNTY FFY03 SHSGP-1 EQUIPMENT GRANT

FOR LOCAL EMERGENCY RESPONDERS TO HAVE EQUIPMENT TO 
PROPERLY RESPOND TO ALL HAZARDS

06/09/22 $1,365.91 INTERLOCAL PD

2004 166 KING COUNTY 2004-05 COMMUTE TRIP REDUCTION IMPLEMENTATION AGREEMENT 06/30/05 2011 INTERLOCAL PW

2004 164 CITY OF KENT VEHICLE EQUIPMENT MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR SERVICES - ILA 06/09/22 ACTIVE INTERLOCAL PD

2004 157 KING COUNTY TRIP REDUCTION PERFORMANCE INCENTIVE PROGRAM 09/30/05 2011 INTERLOCAL PW
2004 147 KING COUNTY FALL 2004 SPECIAL RECYCLE EVENT 10/02/04 2010 INTERLOCAL PW
2004 145 KING COUNTY HOMELAND SECURITY SUBGRANT AGREEMENT 03/01/05 2011 INTERLOCAL PW
2004 141 WASHINGTON STATE PURCHASE OF MUNICIPAL COURT COMPUTERS 12/31/04 2010 INTERLOCAL IT
2004 140 KING CO., PUYALLUP AND MUCKLESHOOT 

TRIBES, DEPT OF ECOLOGY, DEPT OF NATURAL 
RESOURCES, NOAA, DEPT OF INTERIOR, US 
FISH AND WILDLIFE SERVICE, BUREAU OF 
INDIAN AFFAIRS

HYLEBOS PROPERTY TRANSFER COOPERATIVE AGREEMENTS PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL PK

2004 137 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT RESTORATION OF WALL 17 & 18 ON S 332ND ST PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL PW
2004 132 KING COUNTY 2004 CDBG 03/31/06 2062 INTERLOCAL CD
2004 120 WASHINGTON STATE EXOTIC PLANT CONTROL - CELEBRATION PARK WETLAND 

MAINTENANCE
12/31/04 2010 INTERLOCAL PK

2004 110 KING COUNTY LAKOTA WETLANDS CONSERVATION FUTURES INTERLOCAL 
AGREEMENT

PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL PK

2004 100 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS FORBEARANCE AGREEMENT ONGOING INTERLOCAL PW
2004 091 SOUND TRANSIT SOUND TRANSIT CENTER ROW S 316TH / 23RD AVE S ONGOING ONGOING INTERLOCAL PW
2004 085 WASHINGTON STATE VEHICLE AND VESSEL PUBLIC RECORD INFORMATION ONGOING ACTIVE INTERLOCAL MAYOR
2004 080 KING COUNTY 2004 - 2005 WASTE REDUCTION AND RECYCLING 12/31/05 2011 INTERLOCAL PW
2004 076 WASHINGTON STATE 2004-05 COORDINATED PREVENTION GRANT CONTRACT 12/31/05 2011 INTERLOCAL PW
2004 061 CITY OF AUBURN INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT - CUSTODY OF MISDEMEANOR INMATES 12/31/04 2010 INTERLOCAL PD
2004 049 FEDERAL WAY FIRE DEPARTMENT INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT - LEASE IN NEW CITY HALL 12/31/14 2015 INTERLOCAL CD

2004 047 KING COUNTY SPRING 2004 SPECIAL RECYCLING EVENT 03/27/04 2010 INTERLOCAL PW
2004 039 KING COUNTY 21ST AVE SW / SW 312TH TO SW 336TH ST SIGNAL 

SYNCHRONIZATION (GRANT)
12/31/04 2010 INTERLOCAL PW

PAGE 20 OF 32 LAST REVISED 9/29/2023



CITY OF FEDERAL WAY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS

2004 030 WASHINGTON STATE WEST HYLEBOS BOARDWALK GRANT 06/30/09 2015 $245,625.00 INTERLOCAL PK

2004 029 WASHINGTON STATE HISTORICAL CABINS PARK GRANT 06/30/07 2013 INTERLOCAL PK
2004 027 CITY OF SEATTLE ILA - MARINE SHORELINE MAPPING 12/31/04 2010 INTERLOCAL PW
2004 015 FEDERAL WAY FIRE DEPARTMENT INTERLOCAL TRANSFER OF ASSETS AGREEMENT 02/28/04 2010 $1,400.00 INTERLOCAL PD

2003 215 WASHINGTON STATE I-5 TO CITY CENTER ACCESS STUDY 12/31/05 2011 INTERLOCAL PW
2003 212 WASHINGTON STATE FY 2004 GROWTH MANAGEMENT UPDATE GRANT 12/31/04 2010 INTERLOCAL CD
2003 204 KING COUNTY 2003-04 COMMUTE TRIP REDUCTION ACT IMPLEMENTATION AGMT 06/30/04 2010 INTERLOCAL PW

2003 198 WASHINGTON STATE SR-99 HOV LANES PH I & II (PROJ. ANALYSIS) IN-SVC DESIGN EVAL 
OF MEDIAN TREES - 

01/02/07 2013 INTERLOCAL PW

2003 197 WASHINGTON STATE BASIC LAW ENFORCEMENT ACADEMY PROGRAM 11/30/05 2011 INTERLOCAL PD
2003 196 WASHINGTON STATE COMMUTE TRIP REDUCTION IMPLEMENTATION PLANS 06/30/05 2011 INTERLOCAL PW
2003 187 WASHINGTON STATE PACIFIC HIGHWAY SOUTH HOV LANES PHASE III (LOCAL AGENCY 

AGMT) (#141)
04/06/10 2016 INTERLOCAL PW

2003 183 WSP/BELLEVUE PD/KIRKLAND PD/TACOMA PD HGI STINGER-EQUIPPED BAIT VEHICLES MOU 08/22/08 2014 INTERLOCAL PD
2003 181 WASHINGTON STATE I-5 @ 272ND ST FEDERAL WAY FEASIBILITY STUDY 12/31/03 2009 INTERLOCAL PW
2003 173 WASHINGTON STATE INTERAGENCY AGREEMENT - NARCOTICS CANINE 09/05/03 2009 INTERLOCAL PD
2003 170 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT BELLACARINO POND SEWER EXTENSION 06/30/04 2010 INTERLOCAL PW
2003 164 KING COUNTY USE OF TWIN LAKES METRO PARK-N-RIDE FOR RECYCLING EVENT 09/27/03 2009 INTERLOCAL PW
2003 163 U.S. FEDERAL GOVERNMENT FEDERAL EQUITABLE SHARING AGREEMENT 09/30/05 2011 INTERLOCAL PD
2003 161 KING COUNTY KC INSTITUTIONAL NETWORK (I-NET) SERVICES ONGOING ONGOING INTERLOCAL IT

2003 153 WASHINGTON STATE GRANT - CENTENNIAL CLEAN WATER FUND - WEST HYLEBOS CR 
RESTORATION

09/20/08 2014 INTERLOCAL PW

2003 150 CITY OF SEATTLE FUNDING FOR REINVESTING IN YOUTH - HUMAN SERVICES 
AGREEMENT

12/31/03 2009 INTERLOCAL PD

2003 140 BENTON COUNTY AGREEMENT FOR USE OF JAIL FACILITIES IN KENNEWICK 12/31/03 2009 INTERLOCAL PD
2003 127 WASHINGTON STATE SPONSOR CONTRACT - CELEBRATION PK - WETLAND MAINT - EXOTIC 

PLANT CONTROL
04/30/04 2010 INTERLOCAL PK

2003 124 VALLEY SPECIAL RESPONSE TEAM INTERLOCAL COOP - AUBURN, FEDWAY, KENT, RENTON, TUKWILA, 
PORT OF SEATTLE

ONGOING ONGOING INTERLOCAL PD

2003 098 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT PERMANENT SEWER EASEMENT & TEMPORARY CONSTRUCTION 
EASEMENT IN CORONADO VILLAGE

PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL PK

2003 072 WASHINGTON STATE S 288TH ST/MILITARY RD S - FUEL TAX GRANT DISTRIB 12/21/04 2010 INTERLOCAL PW
2003 071 WASHINGTON STATE PAC HWY S HOV LANES PH II (CONST ONLY) -FUEL TAX GRANT 

DISTRIB
01/02/07 2013 INTERLOCAL PW

2003 059 KING COUNTY 2003 CDBG CONTRACT 05/31/05 2061 INTERLOCAL CD
2003 052 KING COUNTY HOME FREE GUARANTEE AGREEMENT 12/31/03 2009 INTERLOCAL PW
2003 046 CITIES OF AUBURN, BURIEN, DES MOINES, 

KENT, RENTON, SEATAC, TUKWILA
MOU - JOINT HUMAN SERVICES APPLICATIONS ONGOING ONGOING $186,400.00 INTERLOCAL CD

2003 042 KING COUNTY LICENSE - SPRING RECYCLING EVENT -TWIN LAKES PARK N RIDE 04/26/03 2009 INTERLOCAL PW
2003 033 WASHINGTON STATE CONSTRUCTION PROSPECTUS - PAC HWY S HOV LANES PHASE II 

(URBAN FUNDING PROGRAM)
01/02/07 2013 INTERLOCAL PW

PAGE 21 OF 32 LAST REVISED 9/29/2023



CITY OF FEDERAL WAY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS

2003 030 WASHINGTON STATE FUEL TAX GRANT - PAC HWY HOV LANES PHASE II, S 324TH ST 01/02/07 2013 INTERLOCAL PW
2003 029 WASHINGTON STATE PAC HWY HOV LANES PHASE III FUEL TAX GRANT DISTRIBUTION  

(#141)
04/06/10 2016 INTERLOCAL PW

2003 026 CITY OF KENT AGREEMENT & RELEASE/DISCLAIMER FOR USE OF SHOOTING RANGE 06/09/22 ONGOING INTERLOCAL PD

2003 023 WASHINGTON STATE NEW FWSD HIGH SCHOOL ON 16TH AVE S - TRAFFIC MITIGATION 
WORK

12/31/04 2010 INTERLOCAL PW

2003 021 KING COUNTY SIGNAL SYNCHRONIZATION ON S 320TH BETWEEN SR99 & 1ST AV S 12/31/03 2009 INTERLOCAL PW

2003 020 SEATTLE-KING COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF 
PUBLIC HEALTH

LOCAL HAZARDOUS WASTE MANAGEMENT PROGRAM 12/31/05 2011 INTERLOCAL PW

2003 019 WASHINGTON STATE LAG - S 288TH ST (SR99 TO MILITARY RD, 16TH AVE S TO 19TH AVE 
S)

12/21/04 2010 INTERLOCAL PW

2003 015 WASHINGTON STATE ARTERIAL IMP GRANT -HOV LANES PHASE II, STAGE 2, S 324TH ST @ 
SR99 (URBAN FUNDING PROGRAM)

10/31/03 2009 INTERLOCAL PW

2003 009 WASHINGTON STATE CERTIFICATION ACCEPTANCE QUALIFICATION (FEDERAL GRANTS) PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL PW
2003 001 KING COUNTY HOME FREE GUARANTEE 12/31/04 2010 INTERLOCAL PW
2002 142 YAKIMA COUNTY JAIL SERVICES - INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT 12/31/10 2016

ARCHIVE
INTERLOCAL MAYOR

2002 139 KING COUNTY JAIL SERVICES 12/31/12 2018 INTERLOCAL MAYOR

2002 132 KING COUNTY COMMUTE TRIP REDUCTION IMPLEMENTATION 06/30/03 2009 INTERLOCAL PW
2002 130 WASHINGTON STATE AQUATIC WEEDS MNGT FUND GRANT AGREEMENT 12/31/04 2010 INTERLOCAL PW
2002 117 UNITED STATES FINAL ASSISTANCE AWARD FOR CULVERT REPLACEMENT ON 

HYLEBOS CRK
06/30/03 2009 INTERLOCAL PW

2002 106 KING COUNTY PARK-N-RIDE USE PERMIT FOR FALL SPECIAL RECYCLING EVENT 09/28/02 2008 INTERLOCAL PW
2002 102 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT ILA - SO 288TH ST, SR99 TO MILITARY RD SO 12/21/04 2010 INTERLOCAL PW
2002 091 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT ILA FOR PAC HWY S HOV LANES PHASE II 01/02/07 2013 INTERLOCAL PW
2002 072 WASHINGTON STATE INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT 06/09/22 ONGOING INTERLOCAL PD

2002 069 KING COUNTY STORAGE SPACE FOR DE-ICING TANK 12/31/12 2018 $6,000.00 INTERLOCAL PW

2002 055 WASHINGTON STATE RETREAT FACILITATOR - INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT 12/31/04 2010 INTERLOCAL CD
2002 051 KING COUNTY 2002-2003 WASTE REDUCTION & RECYCLING GRANT - ILA 12/31/03 2009 INTERLOCAL PW
2002 047 WASHINGTON STATE SPA - PAC HWY S HOV LANES - PHASE II - S 325TH TO S 340TH (GCA 

3280)
01/02/07 2013 INTERLOCAL PW

2002 046 KING COUNTY KING COUNTY SIGNAL SYNCHRONIZATION GRANT 12/31/02 2008 INTERLOCAL PW
2002 045 WATERFOWL MGMT/MULTIPLE CITIES 2002 ILA FOR WATERFOWL 12/31/02 2008 INTERLOCAL PK
2002 043 KING COUNTY 2002 CDBG CONTRACT - FW YMCA CARES CHILD CARE SUBSIDY PROG 

SUPPORT
12/31/02 2008 INTERLOCAL CD

2002 042 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS INTERLOCAL BROADCASTING AGREEMENT BETWEEN CITY & SCHOOL 
DIST

ONGOING INTERLOCAL IT

2002 038 WASHINGTON STATE COORDINATED PREVENTION GRANT OFFER #G0200192 12/31/03 2009 INTERLOCAL PW
2002 026 PUYALLUP TRIBAL POLICE EQUIPMENT LOAN AGREEMENT FOR MOTORCYCLE TRAINING 04/21/02 2008 INTERLOCAL PD

PAGE 22 OF 32 LAST REVISED 9/29/2023



CITY OF FEDERAL WAY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS

2002 018 KING COUNTY USE PERMIT FOR BIANNUAL RECYCLING EVENT 04/27/02 2008 INTERLOCAL PW
2002 014 WASHINGTON STATE SR/99 HOV PHASE I - STATE PARTICIPATING AGREEMENT GCA 3103 12/21/04 2010 INTERLOCAL PW

2002 006 KING COUNTY HOME FREE GUARANTEE PROGRAM AGREEMENT 12/31/02 2008 INTERLOCAL PW
2001 155 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT AGREEMENT TO MODIFY WATER SYSTEM CONNECTION CHARGES PERMANENT PERMANENT $50,000.00 INTERLOCAL MAYOR

2001 154 KING COUNTY LICENSE - USE PERMIT- RECYCLING EVENT AT SO FW PARK-N-RIDE 
ON 9-15-01 (entered 4/15/04)

09/15/01 2007 INTERLOCAL PW

2001 147 FEDERAL WAY FIRE DEPARTMENT ILA-DEVELOPMENT REVIEW PROCESS & ENFORCEMENT OF THE 
UNIFORM FIRE CODE

PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL CD

2001 139 WASHINGTON STATE CTR EMPLOYER ANNUAL REPORT & PROGRAM DESCRIPTION VOID VOID INTERLOCAL PW

2001 136 FEDERAL WAY FIRE/VALLEY COMMUNICATIONS LIABILITY AGREEMENT FOR DISPATCH SERVICES ONGOING ONGOING INTERLOCAL MAYOR

2001 135 FEDERAL WAY FIRE/VALLEY COMMUNICATIONS ILA - FIRE AND EMERGENCY MEDICAL DISPATCH SERVICES ONGOING ONGOING INTERLOCAL MAYOR

2001 134 WASHINGTON STATE TIB GRANT AGREEMENT FOR S 288TH STREET/MILITARY ROAD S AND 
SR 99, MILITARY ROAD TO S 304TH STREET APPROX S STAR LAKE 
ROAD

12/21/04 2010 INTERLOCAL PW

2001 130 KING COUNTY COMMUTE TRIP REDUCTION IMPLEMENTATION 08/30/02 2008 INTERLOCAL PW
2001 125 WASHINGTON STATE I-5/SR-18/SR-161 PRE-DESIGN STUDY (TRIANGLE STUDY) (Interlocal 

Agreement GCA-2986)
12/31/02 REFUSED INTERLOCAL PW

2001 124 WASHINGTON STATE BRETT HATFIELD/BASIC LAW ENFORCEMENT ACADEMY PROGRAM 02/02/03 2009 INTERLOCAL PD
2001 117 WASHINGTON STATE TURNBACK AGREEMENT - SR-99, S 272ND ST TO PIERCE COUNTY 

LINE
PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL PW

2001 113 WASHINGTON STATE COMMUTE TRIP REDUCTION PLAN AND PROGRAM 06/30/03 2009 INTERLOCAL PW
2001 106 WASHINGTON STATE ILA-DISCLOSING VEHICLE & VESSEL RECORD INFORMATION 04/01/06 2012 INTERLOCAL MAYOR
2001 100 WASHINGTON STATE STATE PARTICIPATING AGREEMENT - ACP OVERLAY ON EXISTING SR 

99 AND S 288TH STREET
12/21/04 2010 INTERLOCAL PW

2001 099 SOUND TRANSIT DEVELOPMENT OF A TRANSIT CENTER, PARKING STRUCTURE, AND 
FREEWAY ACCESS

02/28/06 2012 INTERLOCAL PW

2001 097 WASHINGTON STATE STATE PARTICIPATING AGREEMENT - ACP OVERLAY ON EXISTING SR 
509 AND 8TH AVENUE SW

03/15/03 2009 INTERLOCAL PW

2001 096 KING CO/ ALGONA/ AUBURN/ BURIEN/ 
COVINGTON/ DES MOINES/ FEDERAL WAY/  
ENUMCLAW/ KENT/ MAPLE VALLEY/ NORMANDY 
PARK/ RENTON/ SEATAC/ TUKWILA/ SEATTLE

WATERSHED BASINS WITHIN WATER RESOURCE INVENTORY AREA 9 12/31/06 2012 INTERLOCAL PW

2001 072 CITY OF FIFE HOUSING OF INMATES IN FIFE JAIL 12/31/02 2008 INTERLOCAL PD
2001 055 KING COUNTY SIGNAL SYNCHRONIZATION ON SR99 12/31/01 2007 INTERLOCAL PW
2001 054 WATERFOWL MGMT/MULTIPLE CITIES 2001 ILA FOR WATERFOWL 12/31/01 2007 INTERLOCAL PK
2001 051 CITY OF TACOMA 23RD AVE S ROAD IMP, S 316 TO S 324 12/03/02 2008 INTERLOCAL PW
2001 041 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT SR 99 HOV LANES PHASE I 12/21/04 2010 INTERLOCAL PW
2001 040 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT ILA-23RD AVE S, S 316TH TO S 324TH 12/03/02 2008 INTERLOCAL PW

PAGE 23 OF 32 LAST REVISED 9/29/2023



CITY OF FEDERAL WAY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS

2001 035 KING COUNTY 2001 CDBG GRANT 12/31/01 2007 INTERLOCAL CD
2001 004 KING COUNTY HOME FREE GUARANTEE PROGRAM 12/31/01 2007 INTERLOCAL PW
2000 175 WASHINGTON STATE SR99 HOV LANES - PHASE II - S 324TH ST TO S 340TH ST - DESIGN 01/02/07 2013 INTERLOCAL PW

2000 169 WASHINGTON STATE SR 99 HOV LANES PHASE II - STATE PARTICIPATING AGREEMENT 01/02/07 2013 INTERLOCAL PW
2000 167 YAKIMA COUNTY HOUSING OF INMATES - INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT 12/31/10 2016 INTERLOCAL PD
2000 162 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANS ST PART AGR-21ST AVENUE SW (TWIN LAKES PARK AND RIDE) 12/31/02 2008 INTERLOCAL PW

2000 161 CHELAN COUNTY HOUSING OF INMATES/REG JAIL 12/31/01 2007 INTERLOCAL PD
2000 160 OKANOGAN COUNTY JAIL SERVICES AGREEMENT 09/06/04 2010 INTERLOCAL PD
2000 157 KING COUNTY 2000-2001 WASTE REDUCTION & RECYCLING GRANT 12/31/01 2007 INTERLOCAL PW
2000 156 FEDERAL WAY SOCCER ASSOCIATION & 

FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
SACAJAWEA PARK SPORTS FIELD IMPS PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL PK

2000 152 WASHINGTON STATE ILA FOR IMPS AT WEST HYLEBOS ST PK 06/30/01 2007 INTERLOCAL PK
2000 151 KING COUNTY & SOROPTIMIST 

INTERNATIONAL OF FEDERAL WAY
MAINT OF FLAGPOLES/KC AQUATIC CTR ONGOING INTERLOCAL PK

2000 149 LAKEHAVEN & FEDERAL WAY FIRE DISTRICT EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT CONSULTING SERVICES 12/31/05 2011 INTERLOCAL PW
2000 148 WASHINGTON STATE SR 99 HOV LANES, PHASE I S 325 TO S 310 12/21/04 2010 INTERLOCAL PW
2000 140 WASHINGTON STATE INTERAGENCY AGR/HYLEBOS ST PK 06/30/01 2007 INTERLOCAL PK
2000 122 KING COUNTY PUBLIC DEFENSE SCREENING SERVICES ONGOING ONGOING INTERLOCAL MAYOR
2000 120 CITY OF DES MOINES ILA FOR ACCESS SERVICES PERF & PROCESS 01/31/01 2007 INTERLOCAL PD
2000 117 WASHINGTON STATE STATE PARTICIPATING AGREEMENT SR 99 HOV, PHASE I S 325 TO S 

310
12/21/04 2010 INTERLOCAL PW

2000 115 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT ILA FOR SEA TAC MALL DETENT PH II 12/31/02 2008 INTERLOCAL PW
2000 110 WASHINGTON STATE LAG-SR 99 @ S 330TH ST IMPROVEMENTS ONGOING INTERLOCAL PW
2000 109 WASHINGTON STATE LAG-SR99, HOV LANES, S 310TH ST TO S 325TH ST - PHASE I 12/21/04 2010 INTERLOCAL PW
2000 108 KING COUNTY COMMUTE TRIP REDUCTION IMPLEMENTATION 06/30/01 2007 INTERLOCAL PW
2000 104 CITY OF KENT MOI FOR STAR LAKE BASIN DRAINAGE PROJECT ONGOING INTERLOCAL PW
2000 103 KING COUNTY HOME FREE GUARANTEE PROGRAM 12/31/00 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
2000 092 KING COUNTY 2000 CDBG GRANT ONGOING INTERLOCAL CD
2000 090 VALLEY COMMUNICATIONS CENTER ILA - EMERGENCY DISPATCH SERVICES ONGOING ONGOING INTERLOCAL PD
2000 088 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS HEAD START PROGRAM 12/31/00 2006 INTERLOCAL CD
2000 078 WASHINGTON STATE BPA TRAIL PH III LAG SUPPLEMENT 12/04/01 2009 INTERLOCAL PW
2000 075 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT ILA-S 320TH ST & SR 99 IMP PROJ ONGOING INTERLOCAL PW
2000 072 KING COUNTY USE PERMIT FOR RECYCLING EVENT ONGOING INTERLOCAL PW
2000 069 WASHINGTON STATE ARTS CAPITAL FACILITIES GRANT FOR KFT 06/30/03 2009 INTERLOCAL PK
2000 068 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT BILL OF SALE FOR WATER FACILITIES-S 312TH ONGOING $241,694.43 INTERLOCAL PW

2000 058 WASHINGTON STATE COLLECTION OF NATURAL GAS USE TAX ONGOING INTERLOCAL FI
2000 038 WASHINGTON STATE COORDINATED PREVENTION GRANT 12/31/01 2007 INTERLOCAL PW
2000 017 KING COUNTY COMMUTE TRIP REDUCTION ACT 06/30/01 2007 INTERLOCAL PW
2000 011 KING COUNTY 2000 CITY OPTIONAL PROGRAM GRANT 12/31/00 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1999 162 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS SCHOOL RESOURCE OFFICERS 06/30/04 2010 INTERLOCAL PD

PAGE 24 OF 32 LAST REVISED 9/29/2023



CITY OF FEDERAL WAY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS

1999 159 WASHINGTON STATE LTD REIMB FOR JIS EQUIPMENT 06/30/00 2006 INTERLOCAL MAYOR
1999 151 WASHINGTON STATE S 320TH/SR 99 INTERSECTION IMPROVEMENTS ONGOING INTERLOCAL PW
1999 150 WASHINGTON STATE PACIFIC HWY HOV LANES - TIA GRANT ONGOING INTERLOCAL PW
1999 145 KING COUNTY CDBG & HOME CONSORTIUM INTERLOCAL COOP HOME INVESTMENT PROG & JOINT CDBG 

AGREEMENT
10/27/08 2054 INTERLOCAL CD

1999 136 KING COUNTY HOME FREE GUARANTEE 12/31/99 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1999 097 CITY OF TACOMA MITIGATION OF WATER SUPPLY PIPELINE ONGOING INTERLOCAL CD
1999 072 HIGHLINE WATER DISTRICT STAR LAKE RD WATER MAIN REPLACE 04/30/99 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1999 063 KING COUNTY USE PERMIT - SPRING RECYCLING DAY 09/11/99 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1999 061 KING COUNTY 1999 CDBG AGREEMENT 12/31/99 2006 INTERLOCAL CD
1999 059 WASHINGTON STATE REAL PROP ACQUISITION/ROW PROCEED PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL PW
1999 055 KING COUNTY COMMUTE TRIP REDUCTION AGREEMENT 12/31/99 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1999 032 KING COUNTY KOREAN  ELDERS PROGRAM 05/31/00 2006 INTERLOCAL PK
1999 031 KING COUNTY RECYCLING EVENTS GRANT FUNDING 12/31/99 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1999 007 CITY OF TACOMA SW 340TH/HOYT ROAD INTERSECTION ONGOING INTERLOCAL PW
1999 005 KING COUNTY/MUCKLESHOOT TRIBE SEVERAL KING COUNTY CITIES/MUCKLESHOOT 12/31/00 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1998 195 KING COUNTY CTR IMPLEMENTATION AGREEMENT 12/31/98 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1998 181 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS DECATUR HS ADOPT A STREAM 07/30/99 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1998 179 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS INTERLOCAL:  EMERGENCY SHELTER FACILITIES ONGOING INTERLOCAL LAW
1998 168 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT CROWN PT SEWER LINE REPLACEMENT 12/31/08 2014 INTERLOCAL PW
1998 157 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS GIRLS BASKETBALL CLINIC 06/25/98 2006 INTERLOCAL PK
1998 146 CITY OF KENT INTERLOCAL: ASSUMP OF LAKEHAVEN ONGOING ONGOING INTERLOCAL LAW

1998 145 CITY OF AUBURN INTERLOCAL:  ASSUMP OF LAKEHAVEN ONGOING ONGOING INTERLOCAL LAW

1998 144 CITY OF DES MOINES INTERLOCAL: ASSUMP OF LAKEHAVEN ONGOING ONGOING INTERLOCAL LAW

1998 131 WASHINGTON STATE COORDINATED PREVENTION GRANT 12/31/99 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1998 125 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT S. 312TH ST. SR99 TO 23RD AVE SW 12/31/99 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1998 118 WASHINGTON STATE RELEASE OF VEHICLE & VESSEL RECORDS 05/29/00 2006 INTERLOCAL CD
1998 099 KING COUNTY HOME FREE GUARANTEE PROGRAM 12/31/98 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1998 095 KING COUNTY 1998 CDBG CONTRACT & EXHIBITS 12/31/99 2006 INTERLOCAL CD
1998 092 KING COUNTY INTERLOCAL - COMMUTE TRIP REDUCTION 12/31/98 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1998 090 KING COUNTY GRANT FUNDING - RECYCLING EVENTS 12/31/98 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1998 089 CITY OF KENT AND KING COUNTY CITY OF KENT & KING CO. MOU RE: MEDIC ONE SERVICES PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL LAW
1998 063 WASHINGTON STATE LAND ACQUISITION - 23RD AVE. S./S. 317 12/03/02 2008 INTERLOCAL PW
1998 055 KING COUNTY SENIOR SERVICES CONTRACT - 1998 12/31/98 2006 INTERLOCAL CD
1998 051 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT DEVELOPER EXTENSION AGREEMENT 12/31/98 2006 INTERLOCAL PK
1998 030 KING COUNTY CULTURAL RESOURCES 

PROGRAM
CONSULTANT - KING COUNTY ARTS PROGRAM 08/31/98 2006 INTERLOCAL PK

PAGE 25 OF 32 LAST REVISED 9/29/2023



CITY OF FEDERAL WAY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS

1997 230 WASHINGTON STATE SR99 - PAC HWY SO - REDEVELOPMENT DESIGN STUDY UPON 
COMPLETION

UPON 
COMPLETION

INTERLOCAL PW

1997 229 WASHINGTON STATE LAG - PAC HWY, S 310TH TO S 325TH 12/21/04 2010 INTERLOCAL PW
1997 211 WASHINGTON STATE SALE OF SURPLUS ITEMS - PUBLIC AUCTION 12/31/98 2006 INTERLOCAL FI
1997 194 KING COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 911 TELECOMMUNICATIONS SYSTEMS 09/01/04 2010 INTERLOCAL IT
1997 181 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT SW DASH PT RD. @ 21ST AVE. SW 04/30/98 2004 INTERLOCAL PW
1997 175 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT SW 336/21ST AVE TO 26PL SW IMPROV. PROJ. 07/01/98 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1997 162 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS INTERLOCAL - MARK TWAIN ELEM. SCHOOL 06/09/22 PERMANENT INTERLOCAL PD

1997 161 WASHINGTON STATE STATE ADMIN. OF SALES & USE TAX ONGOING ONGOING INTERLOCAL FI
1997 152 KING COUNTY RECYCLING GRANT CONTRACT 01/15/00 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1997 124 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT BPA FOOTBRIDGE LICENSE & INDEM. 03/05/28 2034 INTERLOCAL PK
1997 113 KING COUNTY GRANT FUNDING/SPECIAL RECYCLING EVENTS 12/31/97 2009 INTERLOCAL PW
1997 107 PUBLIC SAFETY DEPT. - CONFIDENTIAL LEASE CONFIDENTIAL LEASE AGREEMENT 04/30/00 2006 INTERLOCAL PD

1997 092 ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT COUNCIL OF 
SEATTLE & KING COUNTY

PUBLIC SECTOR SERVICE CONTRACT 12/31/97 2006 INTERLOCAL LAW

1997 091 PIERCE COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF ASSIGNED COUNSEL 12/31/98 2006 INTERLOCAL LAW
1997 088 KING COUNTY DUMAS BAY CENTRE IMPROVEMENTS 12/31/97 2006 INTERLOCAL CD
1997 086 KING COUNTY CHILDCARE SUBS./SCHOLAR. (SEE 97-82) 12/31/97 2006 INTERLOCAL CD
1997 085 KING COUNTY CDBG PLANN. & ADMIN. (SEE 97-82) 12/31/97 2006 INTERLOCAL CD
1997 082 KING COUNTY 1997 COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT BLOCK GRANT 12/31/97 2006 INTERLOCAL CD
1997 017 KING COUNTY 1997 CTR AGREEMENT 12/31/97 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1997 008 KING COUNTY HOME FREE GUARANTEE PROGRAM AGREEMENT 12/31/97 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1996 271 CITY OF KENT JAIL HOUSING AGREEMENT 12/31/97 2006 INTERLOCAL PD
1996 266 VALLEY COMMUNICATIONS CENTER EMERGENCY DISPATCH AGREEMENT  MOU 96-259 04/04/00 2009 INTERLOCAL PD
1996 260 CITY OF AUBURN POLICE DEPARTMENT FIRING RANGE 08/31/98 2006 INTERLOCAL PD
1996 259 VALLEY COMMUNICATIONS CENTER EMERGENCY DISPATCH SERVICES 10/16/96 2006 INTERLOCAL PD
1996 258 CITY OF FEDERAL WAY JURIED ART SHOW/39 VARIOUS ARTISTS 11/21/96 2006 INTERLOCAL PK
1996 238 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT WATER QUALITY MONITORING STATIONS 07/18/06 INTERLOCAL PW

1996 234 WASHINGTON STATE COMMUNITY FORESTRY GRANT/STEEL LAKE PARK 06/30/97 2006 INTERLOCAL PK
1996 214 KING COUNTY CONSORTIUM 1997-99 CDBG - INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT 12/31/99 2006 INTERLOCAL CD
1996 213 KING COUNTY CONSORTIUM 1997-99 HOME INVESTMENT PROGRAM-INTERLOCAL 12/31/99 2006 INTERLOCAL CD
1996 211 WASHINGTON STATE COORDINATED PREVENTION GRANT 12/31/97 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1996 208 WASHINGTON STATE STRIPING: F B HOIT BRIDGE TO 21ST AVE SW 12/31/96 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1996 202 KING COUNTY ARTS & HERITAGE INITIATIVE GRANT 12/31/96 2006 INTERLOCAL PK
1996 193 CITY OF RENTON ELECTRONIC HOME DETENTION PROGRAM POTENTIAL 

ARCHIVE
INTERLOCAL LAW

1996 192 KING COUNTY FAMILY FEST TEMP USE PERMIT/PARK & RIDE 07/07/96 2006 INTERLOCAL PK
1996 178 KING COUNTY BPA BICYCLE TRAIL PHASE II PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL PK

PAGE 26 OF 32 LAST REVISED 9/29/2023



CITY OF FEDERAL WAY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS

1996 174 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS INTERLOCAL: SCHOOL IMPACT FEES PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL CD
1996 165 WASHINGTON STATE FEMA FUNDING POTENTIAL 

ARCHIVE
INTERLOCAL PW

1996 141 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT EASEMENT (WATER):  PANTHER LAKE PROJECT PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL PW
1996 132 KING COUNTY BUS ZONE ACCESS IMPROV/RIGHT OF WAY 08/30/97 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1996 129 SNOHOMISH TRIBE OF INDIANS CANOE CARVING DEMONSTRATION 06/30/96 2006 INTERLOCAL PK
1996 126 KING COUNTY INTERLOCAL AG/GRANT FUNDING/SPEC. RECYC. 12/31/96 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1996 112 KING COUNTY SERVICES TO OLDER ADULTS 12/31/96 2006 INTERLOCAL PK
1996 107 KING COUNTY GIS SOFTWARE & SERVICES AGREEMENT 11/30/97 2006 INTERLOCAL IT
1996 097 WASHINGTON STATE SURPLUS BY PUBLIC AUCTION PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL FI
1996 075 KING COUNTY PUBLIC ARTWORK FOR STEEL LAKE PARK 03/25/06 REFUSED INTERLOCAL PK

1996 064 KING COUNTY KOREAN FESTIVAL AT THE LIBRARY 12/31/96 2006 INTERLOCAL PK
1996 037 WASHINGTON STATE SR 161/JOVITA TO SR 18 WIDENING-STAGE I 12/31/08 2014 INTERLOCAL PW
1996 031 KING COUNTY CDBG AGREEMENT WITH THREE EXHIBITS 12/31/96 2006 INTERLOCAL CD
1996 026 KING COUNTY COMMUTE TRIP REDUCTION ACT 08/31/97 2009 INTERLOCAL PW
1996 025 KING COUNTY COMMUTE TRIP REDUCTION IMPLEMENT. AGREE. 12/31/96 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1996 011 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS LAKOTA JUNIOR HIGH/CITY INTERLOCAL AG ONGOING INTERLOCAL PK
1995 273 KING COUNTY PURCHASE & STEWARDSHIP/ART/STEEL LK. PARK 09/15/05 2011 INTERLOCAL PK
1995 271 KING COUNTY LOCAL HAZARDOUS WASTE MANAGEMENT PLAN GRANT 01/31/03 2009 INTERLOCAL PW
1995 264 KING COUNTY TRAFFIC, ENGINEERING INTERLOCAL AG PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL PW
1995 241 CITY OF MILTON AGREEMENT RE: POTENTIAL ANNEXATION AREA PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL CD
1995 240 CITY OF KENT AGREEMENT RE: POTENTIAL ANNEXATION AREA PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL CD
1995 239 CITY OF DES MOINES AGREEMENT RE: POTENTIAL ANNEXATION AREA PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL CD
1995 238 CITY OF AUBURN AGREEMENT RE: POTENTIAL ANNEXATION AREA PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL CD
1995 237 CITY OF ALGONA AGREEMENT RE: POTENTIAL ANNEXATION AREA PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL CD
1995 227 WASHINGTON STATE PURCHASING AG FOR POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL MAYOR
1995 225 KING COUNTY WASTE REDUCTION/RECYCLING GRANT PROGRAM 04/15/97 2009 INTERLOCAL PW
1995 222 WASHINGTON STATE STORM DRAINAGE PROJECT - 352ND STREET 12/31/08 2014 INTERLOCAL PW
1995 208 ASSOCIATION OF WASHINGTON CITIES DRUG & ALCOHOL TESTING CONSORTIUM SERVICES. 01/01/97 2006 INTERLOCAL HR
1995 197 METRO - SEATTLE/KING CO SPECIAL RECYCLING EVENT-PARK N RIDE USE 10/21/95 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1995 166 FEDERAL WAY SCHOOL DISTRICT / 

LAKEHAVEN/ FIRE
INTERLOCAL BIDDING/PURCHASING AGREEMENT PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL LAW

1995 159 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT EASEMENT ASSIGNMENT AGREEMENT PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL PW
1995 152 KING COUNTY SUMMER CONCERT SERIES - 4TH OF JULY 12/31/95 2006 INTERLOCAL PK
1995 129 PIERCE COUNTY DEPT OF ASSIGNED COUNSEL 12/31/96 2006 INTERLOCAL LAW
1995 124 WASHINGTON STATE BPA TRAIL CORRIDOR - PHASE II 12/31/97 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1995 105 WASHINGTON STATE HAUL RD/DETOUR AGREEMENT FB HOIT/YOUNGLOVE BRIDGES/DECK 

REPLACEMENT
12/31/97 2003 INTERLOCAL PW

1995 097 KING COUNTY S FEDERAL WAY PARK & RIDE/USE PERMIT 04/29/95 2006 INTERLOCAL PW

PAGE 27 OF 32 LAST REVISED 9/29/2023



CITY OF FEDERAL WAY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS

1995 094 WASHINGTON OFFICE OF THE 
ADMINISTRATOR FOR THE COURTS

SERVICE AGREEMENT FOR JIS-LINK ONGOING ONGOING INTERLOCAL IT

1995 087 KING COUNTY VAN FOR TRANSPORTING SENIOR CITIZENS 01/31/00 2006 INTERLOCAL PK
1995 079 KING COUNTY 1992 GMC VAN FOR SENIOR CITIZENS 01/31/00 2006 INTERLOCAL PK
1995 078 KING COUNTY COMMUTE TRIP REDUCTION INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT 12/31/95 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1995 068 KING COUNTY GRANT FUNDING-SPECIAL RECYCLING EVENTS 12/31/95 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1995 066 WASHINGTON STATE S 348TH ST INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT 10/01/95 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1995 052 KING COUNTY 1995 CDBG - PED FACILITIES, EXHIBIT 3 12/31/95 2006 INTERLOCAL CD
1995 051 KING COUNTY 1995 CDBG - CARES PROGRAM, EXHIBIT 2 12/31/95 2006 INTERLOCAL CD
1995 050 KING COUNTY 1995 CDBG - PLANNING/ADM, EXHIBIT 1 12/31/95 2006 INTERLOCAL CD
1995 049 KING COUNTY MARK TWAIN BALLFIELD RENOVATION 12/31/97 2006 INTERLOCAL CD
1995 041 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT EASEMENT:  GROUSEPOINTE DIV. II PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL CD
1995 015 KING COUNTY SERVICES TO OLDER ADULTS 12/31/95 2006 INTERLOCAL CD
1994 268 KING COUNTY KENWOOD PIT SITE/RIGHT OF WAY RECORDED DOC PERMANENT INTERLOCAL PW

1994 266 WASHINGTON STATE SR18/S 348TH/SR161/16TH AVE S TO SR99 - STATE PARTICIPATING 
AGREEMENT

ONGOING INTERLOCAL PW

1994 262 FEDERAL WAY WATER/SEWER STEEL LAKE ANNEX/DOMESTIC SEWER SERVICE RECORDED DOC PERMANENT INTERLOCAL LAW

1994 261 ADAMS COUNTY COOPERATIVE PURCHASING AGREEMENT RECORDED DOC PERMANENT INTERLOCAL FI

1994 260 KING COUNTY COOPERATIVE PURCHASING AGREEMENT RECORDED DOC PERMANENT INTERLOCAL FI

1994 254 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT BILL OF SALE/ COMMUNITY SENIOR CTR DRAFT DRAFT INTERLOCAL PK
1994 244 LAKEHAVEN UTILITY DISTRICT MONITORING STATIONS-LAKEHAVEN PROPERTY 12/31/04 POTENTIAL 

ARCHIVE
INTERLOCAL PW

1994 241 KING COUNTY ART SERVICES CONTRACT #D20376D 12/31/94 2006 INTERLOCAL PK
1994 236 KING COUNTY LOCAL HAZARDOUS WASTE MANAGEMENT PLAN - ROLE 12/31/95 2001 INTERLOCAL PW

1994 233 KING COUNTY INTERLOCAL/RECYCLING PROGRAM 12/31/94 2009 INTERLOCAL PW
1994 232 FEDERAL WAY WATER/SEWER WATERMAIN RELOCATION-SW 356TH ST RECORDED DOC PERMANENT INTERLOCAL PW

1994 228 WASHINGTON STATE SOLID WASTE REDUCTION & RECYCLING 12/31/95 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1994 211 PUGET SOUND POWER & LIGHT CO PRE-ANNEXATION ZONING AGREEMENT ONGOING INTERLOCAL LAW
1994 208 FEDERAL WAY WATER/SEWER DOMESTIC SEWER SERVICE/CONSTRUCTION 08/31/95 2006 INTERLOCAL PK
1994 203 KING COUNTY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT FOR FILING FEES 01/01/00 2006 INTERLOCAL LAW
1994 197 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS HARRY S TRUMAN HIGH SCHOOL/PARK RECORDED DOC PERMANENT INTERLOCAL PK

1994 196 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS LAKE GROVE ELEM/PARK & 94 VOLUNTEER SERVICES 12/31/95 2006 INTERLOCAL PK
1994 195 KING COUNTY CONSERVATION DIST BROOKLAKE RESTORATION ENHANCEMENT COOP 12/31/94 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1994 192 WASHINGTON STATE 20-YR PUB WKS TRUST FUND CONST/LOAN 07/01/14 2020 INTERLOCAL PW

PAGE 28 OF 32 LAST REVISED 9/29/2023



CITY OF FEDERAL WAY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS

1994 183 KING COUNTY FEE-IN-LIEU OF FUNDS 12/31/97 2006 INTERLOCAL PK
1994 172 WASHINGTON STATE HOME DEPOT SIGNAL AT INTERSECTION 12/31/08 2014 INTERLOCAL PW
1994 171 CITY OF PACIFIC INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT; ANNEXATION AREAS RECORDED DOC PERMANENT INTERLOCAL LAW

1994 166 CITY OF FEDERAL WAY ADELAIDE PARK; DECL OF RESTRICTIVE COVENT DRAFT 2012 INTERLOCAL PW
1994 159 WASHINGTON STATE INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT-AUCTION OF VEHICLE 12/31/94 2006 INTERLOCAL FI
1994 155 KING COUNTY SERVICES TO OLDER ADULTS/AGING PROGRAM 12/31/94 2006 INTERLOCAL CD
1994 152 CITY OF TACOMA INTERLOCAL BIDDING/PURCHASING AGREEMENT ONGOING ONGOING INTERLOCAL FI

1994 140 FEDERAL WAY WATER/SEWER EASEMENT/SAGHALIE PARK PROJECT RECORDED DOC PERMANENT INTERLOCAL PK

1994 139 FEDERAL WAY WATER/SEWER PRETREATMENT/KLAHANEE COMMUNITY CENTER 01/01/98 2006 INTERLOCAL PK
1994 123 KING COUNTY COMMUTE TRIP REDUCTION ACT 06/30/95 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1994 118 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS CHILD CARE PROVIDER 06/16/94 2006 INTERLOCAL PK
1994 115 KING COUNTY KLAHANEE ELEVATOR & VISITATION MOD'S. 06/30/96 2006 INTERLOCAL LAW
1994 110 WASHINGTON STATE GROWTH MANAGEMENT ACT/93-95 GRANT FUNDS INTERLOCAL LAW
1994 102 WASHINGTON STATE MULTIMODAL TRANSPORTATION PROG 12/31/95 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1994 101 WASHINGTON STATE STEEL LK AQUATIC PLANT MGMT PROJECT 12/31/95 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1994 096 FEDERAL WAY SCHOOL DISTRICT/CPAC 1994 VOLUNTEER/SPORTS FIELDS IMPROVEMENT 12/31/94 2006 INTERLOCAL PK
1994 087 METRO-SEATTLE/KING CO COMMUTE TRIP RED ACT IMPLEMENTATION 01/31/95 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1994 079 WASHINGTON STATE LETTER OF UNDERSTANDING/320TH & SR99 SIG 12/31/94 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1994 069 KING COUNTY CDBG FUNDS/HUD HOUSING REPAIRS 03/31/96 2006 INTERLOCAL CD
1994 064 KING COUNTY 1993 REG CONSERV FUTURES ACQUISITIONS PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL PK
1994 051 CITY OF TACOMA SOUND EQUIP, BORROWED 12/31/94 2006 INTERLOCAL IT
1994 047 KING COUNTY ANIMAL CONTROL SERVICES 06/30/10 POTENTIAL 

ARCHIVE
INTERLOCAL FI

1994 034 WASHINGTON STATE IAC GRANT/STEEL LAKE PARK 06/30/96 2006 INTERLOCAL PK
1993 291 KING COUNTY HOME PROGRAMS 1994-96 12/31/93 2006 INTERLOCAL CD
1993 290 CITY OF REDMOND SPECIAL BACK-UP PROSECUTION 12/31/93 2006 INTERLOCAL LAW
1993 260 FEDERAL WAY WATER/SEWER TEMP SEWER SERV/28TH AV S & S 312TH 09/16/93 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1993 255 WASHINGTON STATE CAMPUS DRIVE PARK PROJECT GRANT 12/31/95 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1993 250 WASHINGTON STATE WRITING COURSE 12/20/93 2006 INTERLOCAL
1993 247 WASHINGTON STATE S 316TH ST/20TH AVE SO SIGNAL POTENTIAL 

ARCHIVE
INTERLOCAL PW

1993 246 WASHINGTON STATE TRAFFIC SIGNAL COORDINATION PROJECT - S 320TH STREET/SR 99 POTENTIAL 
ARCHIVE

INTERLOCAL PW

1993 245 WASHINGTON STATE 23RD AVE S 12/03/02 2008 INTERLOCAL PW
1993 244 WASHINGTON STATE PARKING POLICY REVIEW PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL PW

PAGE 29 OF 32 LAST REVISED 9/29/2023



CITY OF FEDERAL WAY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS

1993 243 WASHINGTON STATE BPA TRAIL PHASE I 12/31/95 2001 INTERLOCAL PK
1993 238 WASHINGTON STATE AGREEMENT TO NOT CHARGE OVERHEAD BETWEEN DOT AND THE 

CITY
07/01/11 2017 INTERLOCAL PW

1993 217 YAKIMA COUNTY MUTUAL BIDDING AGREEMENT PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL FI
1993 146 KING COUNTY CDBG PROGRAMS 1994-96 12/31/96 2006 INTERLOCAL CD
1993 118 WASHINGTON STATE GROWTH MANAGEMENT ACT 12/31/93 2006 INTERLOCAL
1993 117 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS ELEM SCHOOL #22/ENTERPRISE ELEM RECORDED DOC PERMANENT INTERLOCAL

1993 112 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS LOANED ART WORK 12/31/93 2006 INTERLOCAL
1993 100 WASHINGTON STATE GRANT 12/31/93 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1993 076 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS JR HIGH #6/CITY PARK/SAGHALIE - INTERLOCAL COOP AGREEMT INTERLOCAL PK
1993 054 PIERCE COUNTY DEPT OF ASSIGNED COUNSEL 02/20/95 2006 INTERLOCAL LAW
1993 002 CITY OF SEATAC POLICE FEAS STUDY 12/31/94 2006 INTERLOCAL
1992 245 KING COUNTY INDEMNIFICATION AGREE/CHRISTMAS TREES 01/10/93 2006 INTERLOCAL
1992 237 FEDERAL WAY WATER/SEWER ROAD SNOW & ICE REMOVAL PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL PW
1992 235 KING COUNTY RURAL LIBRARY CAPITAL PROJECT 10/31/92 2006 INTERLOCAL
1992 234 WASHINGTON STATE HAZARDOUS WASTE CLEANUP 11/10/92 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1992 232 WASHINGTON STATE CERTIFICATION ACCEPTANCE QUALIFICATION PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL
1992 228 METRO - SEATTLE/KING CO COMMUTE TRIP REDUCTION ACT INTERLOCAL 01/30/95 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1992 227 KING COUNTY CDBG SERVICES 12/31/93 2009 INTERLOCAL
1992 226 PIERCE COUNTY HOUSING REHAB PROGRAM 09/30/93 2006 INTERLOCAL
1992 215 KING COUNTY ROAD IMPROVEMENT DISTRICTS

TWIN LAKES PARK PLAT/DUMAS BAY ESTATES 3
PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL

1992 163 WASHINGTON STATE STREET CONNECTION/WIDENING/DRAINAGE IMPR 12/31/92 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1992 133 KING COUNTY ESTABLISHING GROWTH MANAGEMENT COUNCIL WITH SEATTLE & 

SUBURBAN CITIES
PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL MAYOR

1992 127 KING COUNTY ROAD IMPROVEMENT MITIGATION FEES 06/30/97 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1992 104 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS WILDWOOD CHILD CARE 06/18/93 2006 INTERLOCAL
1992 102 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS STUDENT ART SHOW 06/08/92 2006 INTERLOCAL
1992 094 US DEPT HOUSING & URBAN DEVELOPMENT FUNDING CDBG GRANT PROGRAM/GRANT AMT 12/31/93 2009 INTERLOCAL
1992 091 FEDERAL WAY WATER/SEWER INTERLOCAL-356TH ST RD CONSTR PROJECT 12/31/92 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1992 082 WASHINGTON STATE COOPERATIVE PURCHASING AGREEMENT PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL FI
1992 058 WASHINGTON STATE GRANT FUNDS/GROWTH MGMT ACT OF 1990 06/30/92 2006 INTERLOCAL
1992 054 WASHINGTON STATE IMPLEMENT & ENFORCE ENERGY CODE 06/30/92 2006 INTERLOCAL
1992 047 KING COUNTY HOME PROGRAM 12/31/93 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1992 046 KING COUNTY CITY-OWNED PROPERTY USE PERMITS 03/01/94 2006 INTERLOCAL
1992 039 DES MOINES/FEDERAL WAY AIRPORT EXPERT SERVICES 02/04/93 2006 INTERLOCAL
1992 037 KING COUNTY SEA/SCA GROWTH MANAGEMENT 07/01/92 2006 INTERLOCAL
1992 028 KING COUNTY SEXUAL ASSAULT RESOURCE CENTER 12/31/92 2006 INTERLOCAL
1992 018 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS CULTURAL ARTS SERVICES 12/31/91 2006 INTERLOCAL
1991 129 WASHINGTON STATE S & SW 356TH/21ST AV SW-SR99 06/17/99 2005 INTERLOCAL PW
1991 128 WASHINGTON STATE WORK STUDY PROGRAM 06/30/92 2006 INTERLOCAL

PAGE 30 OF 32 LAST REVISED 9/29/2023



CITY OF FEDERAL WAY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS

1991 126 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS PARKS/REC/HS PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL
1991 112 WASHINGTON STATE CITY CENTER PARK FUNDING (SEE AG #91-22) 12/31/91 2006 INTERLOCAL
1991 111 KING COUNTY 5 UNITS LOW-INCOME HOUSING (RES #91-84) 12/31/92 2009 INTERLOCAL
1991 109 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS SACAJAWEA JR HI PARK/PROPERTY USE 10/26/16 2022 INTERLOCAL

1991 105 WASHINGTON STATE WORK STUDY PROGRAM 06/03/92 2006 INTERLOCAL
1991 102 PIERCE COUNTY HOUSING REHAB PROGRAM 12/31/92 2006 INTERLOCAL
1991 098 FEDERAL WAY PUBLIC SCHOOLS CULTURAL ARTS SERVICES 12/31/91 2006 INTERLOCAL
1991 096 KING COUNTY SOUTHEND DWI TASK FORCE (ORD #91-91) 12/31/91 2006 INTERLOCAL
1991 083 FEDERAL WAY WATER/SEWER MIS/MANAGEMENT PLAN RECORDED DOC ONGOING INTERLOCAL

1991 079 KING COUNTY TRANSFER PARK PROPERTY-STEEL LAKE PARK INTERLOCAL
1991 076 WASHINGTON STATE INTERGOV COOP/LAND AGENT 12/31/93 2009 INTERLOCAL
1991 075 WASHINGTON STATE COOPERATIVE PURCHASING AGREEMENT ONGOING ONGOING INTERLOCAL FI

1991 070 KING COUNTY LAND USE PERMITS/CITY OWNED PROPERTIES PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL
1991 069 WASHINGTON STATE GRANT FUNDS/GROWTH MGMT ACT OF 1990 PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL
1991 066 CITY OF SEATTLE PURCHASING COOP/RADIO EQUIP 800 MHz ONGOING ONGOING INTERLOCAL PD
1991 043 SPOKANE COUNTY COOP PURCHASE/GOODS & SERVICES ONGOING ONGOING INTERLOCAL LAW
1991 038 WASHINGTON STATE EMERGENCY MGMT/FEMA/FLOODING OF 11/9/90 ONGOING POTENTIAL 

ARCHIVE
INTERLOCAL PW

1991 035 WASHINGTON STATE BICYCLE TRAIL DESIGN PROJECT 09/30/91 2009 INTERLOCAL
1991 034 KING COUNTY TRANSFER OF CITY PARKS PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL
1991 033 KING COUNTY ENVIRONMENTAL MITIGATION/TRAFFIC LIGHT 03/07/06 2012 INTERLOCAL
1991 032 US POST OFFICE BULK MAIL PERMIT 10/26/94 2006 INTERLOCAL
1991 026 KING COUNTY TRANSFER PARK PROPERTY-DUMAS BAY PARK INTERLOCAL

1991 025 KING COUNTY TRANSFER PARK PROPERTY-SACAJAWEA PARK INTERLOCAL

1991 018 WASHINGTON STATE SCAN LONG DISTANCE PHONE SERVICES ONGOING ONGOING INTERLOCAL IT
1991 017 FEDERAL WAY FIRE DEPARTMENT TELEPHONE EQUIP 10/01/96 2006 INTERLOCAL
1991 015 KING COUNTY COMM PLAN UPDATE FOR CITY 12/31/92 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1991 006 WASHINGTON STATE HAUL ROAD/DETOUR AGREE/SO 348TH & 320TH 10/16/92 1998 INTERLOCAL
1990 070 KING COUNTY WASTE REDUCTION/RECYCLING MATCHING GRANT 08/31/91 2006 INTERLOCAL PW
1990 069 WASHINGTON STATE SLIDE REPAIR/DETOUR AGREEMENT FOR 39TH AVE SW VICINITY 10/23/91 1997 INTERLOCAL PW
1990 063 PIERCE COUNTY COOP BIDDING/PURCHASING EQUIP & SERVICES VOID VOID INTERLOCAL

1990 062 WASHINGTON STATE SR161, SR18 & 16TH AVE SO FUNDING - LETTER OF AGREEMENT PROJECT 
COMPLETION

POTENTIAL 
ARCHIVE

$336,000.00 INTERLOCAL PW

1990 060 SOUTH KING FIRE AND RESCUE
FEDERAL WAY FIRE DEPARTMENT

DEVELOPMENT REVIEW PROCESS & UNIFORM FIRE CODE 
ENFORCEMENT

PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL CD

1990 057 WASHINGTON STATE CONSULTING/TELECOMMUNICATIONS INTERLOCAL LAW

PAGE 31 OF 32 LAST REVISED 9/29/2023



CITY OF FEDERAL WAY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS

1990 054 WASHINGTON STATE PROP ACQUISITION/HYLEBOS NOS. 1 & 2 PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL LAW
1990 053 SOUTH KING FIRE, LAKEHAVEN UTILITY 

DISTRICT, CITY OF FEDERAL WAY
GOLFUN PROPERTY ACQUISITION (FRENCH LAKE PARK) RECORDED DOC PERMANENT INTERLOCAL LAW

1990 052 KING COUNTY SUBURBAN CITY OPEN SPACE ACQUISITION RECORDED DOC PERMANENT INTERLOCAL PW

1990 051 WASHINGTON STATE COOPERATIVE PURCHASING AGREEMENT ONGOING ONGOING INTERLOCAL FI
1990 047 WASHINGTON STATE CONTRACT/INSURANCE RISK POOL 02/23/91 2009 INTERLOCAL HR
1990 044 FEDERAL WAY FIRE DEPARTMENT PETROLEUM PRODUCTS/VEHICLE MAINT 12/31/90 2006 INTERLOCAL MAYOR
1990 043 KING COUNTY CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT PROJECTS ONGOING ONGOING INTERLOCAL PW
1990 036 KING COUNTY OPEN SPACE ACQUISITION PROJECTS 12/31/10 2016 INTERLOCAL FI

1990 026 KING COUNTY CITY-OWNED REAL PROPERTY USE 02/29/92 2006 INTERLOCAL
1990 025 KING COUNTY B.A.L.D./PROCESSING BLDG PERMITS 03/31/94 2006 INTERLOCAL
1990 023 KING COUNTY SURFACE WATER MGMT SERVICES ONGOING ONGOING INTERLOCAL PW
1990 022 KING COUNTY TAXICABS TAXICABS/FOR HIRE VEHICLES ONGOING ONGOING INTERLOCAL LAW
1990 021 KING COUNTY PRIVATE SECURITY PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL
1990 020 KING COUNTY CDBG TECHNICAL ASSISTANCE 12/31/90 2006 INTERLOCAL
1990 019 KING COUNTY ANIMAL CONTROL SERVICES (SUPERSEDED BY 1994 AGREEEMENT) 12/31/93 1999 INTERLOCAL CD

1990 018 KING COUNTY SOLID WASTE INTERLOCAL AG 12/31/40 2046 INTERLOCAL PW
1990 017 KING COUNTY FILING FEES - DISTRICT COURT PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL
1990 016 KING COUNTY HEALTH SERVICES PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL
1990 015 KING COUNTY JAIL SERVICES 10/31/01 2007 INTERLOCAL MAYOR
1990 014 KING COUNTY ROAD SERVICES/MAINT/TRAFFIC CONTROL PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL PW
1990 013 KING COUNTY POLICE SERVICES 11/16/96 2006 INTERLOCAL LAW
1990 012 KING COUNTY CONTRACT MONITORING/COST DIFFERENTIALS RECORDED DOC ONGOING INTERLOCAL LAW

1990 007 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF 
TRANSPORTATION (WSDOT)

MAINTENANCE: SR-99/SR-161/SR-509 PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL PW

1990 006 STATE OF WASHINGTON, DEPARTMENT OF 
REVENUE

ADMINISTRATION AND COLLECTION OF LOCAL LEASEHOLD EXCISE 
TAX

PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL FI

1990 004 KING COUNTY DIRECTOR'S ASSOCIATION 
(KCDA)

COOPERATIVE PURCHASING AGREEMENT ONGOING ONGOING INTERLOCAL LAW

1990 001 KING COUNTY SEXUAL ASSAULT RESOURCE CTR-HUMAN SVC 12/31/91 2006 INTERLOCAL
1989 010 FEDERAL WAY WATER/SEWER PAYROLL/ACCOUNTING SERVICES 12/31/90 2006 INTERLOCAL
1989 009 CITY OF AUBURN ADDENDUM TO CAG 89-04 02/28/90 2006 INTERLOCAL
1989 008 KING COUNTY COOPERATIVE PURCHASING AGREEMENT 12/31/90 2006 INTERLOCAL
1989 004 CITY OF AUBURN INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT - CLOSED 01/02/90 2006 INTERLOCAL
1989 003 WASHINGTON STATE LOCAL SALES & USE TAX PERMANENT PERMANENT INTERLOCAL

PAGE 32 OF 32 LAST REVISED 9/29/2023


